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Government Notice No. 526 of 1977

CONSTITUTION OF BOTSWANA

Acting Appointment - Minister of Health

IN EXERCISE of the powers conferred by section 42 (3) of the Constitution, His Excellency the President 
has appointed —

The Hon. M.P.K. NWAKO, m.p.,
Minister of Commerce and Industry,

to act as Minister of Health with effect from 5th September, 1977, to 16th September, 1977, inclusive.

DATED this 6th day of September, 1977.

P.L. Steenkamp,
Permanent Secretary, 

Office of the President.

L2/7/98 X

Government Notice No. 527 of 1977
CONSTITUTION OF BOTSWANA

Acting Appointment - Permanent Secretary, 
Office of the President

IN EXERCISE of the powers conferred by section 113 of the Constitution, His Excellency the President 
has appointed —

MBIKANYE CHARLES TIBONE
to act as Permanent Secretary, Office of the President, with effect from 10th September, 1977, to 18th 
September, 1977, inclusive.

DATED this 9th day of September, 1977.

P.L. Steenkamp, 
Permanent Secretary, 

Office of the President.

L2/7I98 X

Government Notice No. 528 o/1977

CONSTITUTION OF BOTSWANA

Acting Appointment - Attorney-General

IN EXERCISE of the powers conferred by section 113 of the Constitution, His Excellency the President 
has appointed —

ELIJAH WILLIAM MODALE JOHN LEGWAILA
to act as Attorney-General with effect from 10th September, 1977, until further notice.

DATED this 8th day of September, 1977.
P.L. Steenkamp, 

Permanent Secretary, 
Office of the President.

L2I7/9S X
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Government Notice No. 529 of 1977
COMPANIES ACT

(Cap. 42:01)

Overpayment of Penalties

DUE to inadvertence a number of companies were, during the period 1st April, 1974, to 1st August, 1977, 
charged excess fees or penalties in respect of the submission of various forms and returns made to the Registrar 
of Companies. This arose as it was mistakenly believed that the revised Seventh Schedule substituted by 
Statutory Instrument No. 13 of 1974 and amended by Statutory No. 19 of 1975 had retrospective effect. 
This was not so. Furthermore, penalties were also inadvertently charged for the non- or late submission of 
the certificate under section 96 (4) of the Act in the mistaken belief that such certificate formed part of the 
annual return required of each company.

Any company which considers it may have paid excess fees or penalties is invited to submit detailed parti­
culars to the Registrar of Companies, whereupon any excess paid will be refunded.

DATED this 7th day of September, 1977.

O.R.N. Kalaben, 
Acting Registrar of Companies.

7.2/7/111 VI

Government Notice No. 530 ofYNll

COMPANIES ACT 
(Cap. 42:01)

Newly Registered Companies

IT IS HEREBY NOTIFIED for general information that the companies listed in the Schedule were 
registered in the month of August, 1977.

DATED this 1st day of September, 1977.

Number Name of Company
2156
2157
2158
2159
2160
2161
2162
2163
2164
2165
2166
2167
2168
2169
2170

Holly Holdings (Proprietary) Limited
V.M. and Sons (Proprietary) Limited
Maano International (Proprietary) Limited
Moremi and Sons Dry Cleaners (Proprietary) Limited
Dzapela Farm (Proprietary) Limited
Afrigems Botswana (Proprietary) Limited
Central Motors (Proprietary) Limited
Pilane Trading Store (Proprietary) Limited
Segale Construction (Proprietary) Limited
Kayvee Ranching (Propeietary) Limited
Tshireletso (Proprietary) Limited
Cyclop Engineering (Botswana) (Proprietary) Limited
Smithlin Forwaring (Proprietary) Limited
Morewear Industries Botswana (Proprietary) Limited
Taboka General Dealers (Proprietary) Limited

O.R.N. Kalaben, 
Acting Registrar of Companies.

7.2/7/111 VI
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Government Notice No. 531 of 1977

COMPANIES ACT
(Cap. 42:01)

Companies Struck off* the Register

IT IS HEREBY NOTIFIED that, in accordance with the provisions of section 277 (6) of the Companies 
Act, the companies listed in the Schedule have been struck off the register and are hereby dissolved.

SCHEDULE

Number Name of Company
170 

1389 
1442
1780
1781 
1863 
1874 
1893

Fibreglass Industries (Proprietary) Limited
Botswana Vision (Proprietary) Limited
Pernegger Designings Botswana (Proprietary) Limited
Air Conditioning and Engineering Co. (Botswana) (Proprietary) Limited
Penman andjochelson (Botswana) (Proprietary) Limited
Liberty Manufacturing and Marketing Company (Proprietary) Limited 
Selebi-Phikwe Fashion Supplies (Proprietary) Limited
ABC Services (Proprietary) Limited

DATED this 6th day of September, 1977.

O.R.N. Kalaben, 
Acting Registrar of Companies.

L2l7/\[\ VI

Government Notice No. 532 o/T977

ROAD TRAFFIC ACT
(Cap. 69:01)

Partial Closure of Roads

IN EXERCISE of the powers conferred by section 78 of the Road Traffic Act, the Minister of Works and 
Communications hereby closes each of the roads specified in the Schedule to all vehicles of a gross weight 
exceeding 14 000 kg, except those in respect of which the Chief Roads Engineer, Ministry of Works and 
Communications, has given written permission to use such road, with effect from 3rd October, 1977.

SCHEDULE

Mahalapye to Serule to Francistown (north to south road)
Zanzibar to Selebi-Phikwe
Martin’s Drift to Palapye 
Parr's Halt to Mahalapye 
Buffalo Drift to Al 
Ramatlabama to Kanye 
Ramatlabama to Lobatse (north to south road).

DATED this 8th day of September, 1977.

N.T.K. Mmono, 
Acting Permanent Secretary, 

Ministry of Works and Communications.

£2/7/209 IV
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Government Notice No. 533 of 1867

STOCK, BONDS AND TREASURY BILLS ACT, 1976 
(6 of 1976)

TREASURY BILLS REGULATIONS, 1976 
(S.I. 143 of 1976)

Treasury Bills - Issue of 9th September, 1977

The Bank of Botswana announce that applications totalling P2 000 000 were received on 8th September, 
1977, for the offer of Pl 000 000 Treasury Bills for issue on 9th September, 1977, at a price of 98.28%.

Applications were scaled down pro rata and applicants received an allotment of 50% of the amount of bills 
applied for.

£2/7/237 /

Government Notice No. 584 o/ 1977

STOCK, BONDS AND TREASURY BILLS ACT, 1976
(6 of 1976)

TREASURY BILLS REGULATIONS, 1976
(S.I. 143 of 1976)

Applications for Government of Botswana Treasury Bills

The Minister of Finance and Development Planning hereby gives notice that applications will be received 
at the Bank of Botswana, Khama Crescent, Gaborone, on Thursday, 22nd September, 1977, at 12 noon, for 
Treasury Bills to be issued under the Stock, Bonds and Treasury Bills Act, 1976, and in accordance with the 
Treasury Bills Regulations, 1976, to the amount of P500 000.

2. The price per cent at which the Bills will be offered will be published by the Bank of Botswana not later 
than 9 a.m. on Thursday, 22nd September, 1977.

3. The Bills will be in amounts of Pl 000 or a multiple of Pl 000. They will be dated 23rd September, 1977, 
and will be due 91 days after date.

4. The Bills will be issued and paid at the Bank of Botswana.
5. Each application must be for a minimum of Pl 000.
6. Applications must be made through a commercial bank in Botswana.
7. Notification will be sent, on the same day as applications are received, to the persons whose applications 

are accepted in whole or in part.
8. Payment in full of the amount due in respect of Such accepted applications must be made to the Bank of 

Botswana by means of cash or by draft or cheque drawn on the Bank of Botswana not later than noon on the 
day on which the relative Bills are to be dated.

9. Applications must be made on the official printed forms which may be obtained from the commercial 
banks or the Accounts and Banking Office, Bank of Botswana.

10. The Minister of Finance and Development Planning reserves the right to reject any application in 
whole or in part.

DATED this 7th day of September, 1977.

P.H.K. Kedikilwe, 
Acting Permanent Secretary, 

Ministry of Finance and Development 
Planning.

FDPC 3/8/25 
£2/7/237 I



752

Government Notice No. 535 of 1977
ELECTORAL ACT

(Cap. 02:07)
Establishment and Names of Polling Stations

IT IS HEREBY NOTIFIED for general information that, in accordance with the provisions of section 5 
(2) of the Electoral Act, I have added to the number of polling stations established as set forth in the Schedule 
to Government Notice No. 152 of 1973.1 have established in respect of the polling stations specified in the first 
column of the Schedule hereto additional polling stations at the places specified in the second column of the 
said Schedule, such polling stations to be known by the names respectively specified in the third column of the 
said Schedule.

SCHEDULE
Polling District Situation of 

Polling Station
Name of
Polling Station

Mankgwenyane

MOLEPOLOLE NO. 22

Bakwena National School Bakwena National
Suping School Suping

St. Paul’s District Commissioner’s St. Paul’s

Borakalalo
Office, Molepolole
M.L.O. Office Borakalalo
Kotolaname Borehole Kotolaname

Loologa Neale School Loologa
Mogotlha Molepolole National Store Mogotlha
Sebele Bakwena Tribal Hall Sebele
Mahetlwe Mahetlwe School Mahetlwe

Lepare Borehole Lepare
Hatsalatladi School Hatsalatladi
Mmamarobole School Mmamarobole

Mogoditshane
KWENENG EAST NO. 23

Mogoditshane School Mogoditshane
Metsemotlhabe School Metsemotlhabe

Lentswe-Le-Tau Lentswe-Le-Tau School Le n tswe- Le-T au
Kgope School Kgope

Kopong Kopong School Kopong
Gamodubu School Gamodubu
Mmopane School Mmopane
Gakgatla Kgotla Gakgatla Kgotla

Medie Medie School Medie

Gabane
KWENENG SOUTH NO. 24

Gabane School Gabane
Mankgodi Kamenakwe School Kamenakwe

Tlowaneng Kgotla Tlowaneng
Mankgodi School Mankgodi
Kumakwane School Kumakwane

Thamaga West Thamaga Western School Thamaga West
Kubung Kgotla Kubung
Gakgatla Dam 18 Gakgatla Dam

Thamaga East Gobuamang Memorial School, Thamaga East

Lephephe

Thamaga
KWENENG WEST NO. 25 

Lephephe School Lephephe
Boatlaname Kgotla Boatlaname
Sobjwe School Sobjwe

Khudumelapye Khudumelapye School Khudumelapye
Salajwe School Salajwe

Letlhakeng Letlhakaneng School Letlhakeng
Moshaweng School Moshaweng
Maboane School Maboane
Metsebotlhoko Kgotla Metsebotlhoko
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iMotokwe

Dutlwe
Botlhapatlou

Motokwe School 
Tsetseng Kgotla 
Dutlwe School 
Botlhapatlou School 
Ngware School 
Mantshwabisi Store 
Marapyane Kgotla

Motokwe
Tsetseng
Dutlwe 
Botlhapatlou
Ngware 
Mantshwabisi
Marapyane

DATED this 9th day of September, 1977.

P.L. Steenkamp, 
Supervisor of Elections.

£2/7/63 I

Government Notice No. 536 of 1977
ELECTORAL ACT

(Cap. 02:07)

Appointment of General Registration Period

IN EXERCISE of the powers conferred by section 7 of the Electoral Act, His Excellency the President 
hereby appoints the period between 3rd October, 1977, and 14th October, 1977, to be a general registration 
period for the constituencies listed in the Schedule.

SCHEDULE

Molepolole
Kweneng East
Kweneng South
Kweneng West

DATED this 9th day of September, 1977.

P.L. Steenkamp,
Permanent Secretary, 

Office of the President.

PUBLIC NOTICES

Republic of Botswana - Tender No. TB 9/3/31/77-78
FRANCISTOWN POST OFFICE

The Government of Republic of Botswana propose to invite tenders based upon bills of quantities for the 
construction and completion of a Post Office at Francistown (plinth area of building about 295 m2). The 
building will be of conventional single-storey construction.

Contractors wishing to be included on the tender list must apply in writing to the Chief Architect, Buildings 
Department, Ministry of Works and Communications, Private Bag 0025, Gaborone, such applications to be 
received by 30th September, 1977.

Tenders will only be considered from Contractors registered under the Companies Act of the Laws of 
Botswana and with Central Tender Board at the date for submission of tenders, or from such Contractors 
who can provide satisfactory proof of intention to apply for such registration under law and with Central 
Tender Board by the above mentioned date provided always that if either registration application defined 
above is not accepted the tender will not be considered for acceptance.

Government of Botswana is not bound to accept the lowest or any tender nor to incur any expense in the 
preparation thereof.

K.K. Semelamela, 
Secretary, Central Tender Board.



754

Licences
Notice is hereby given that the persons specified hereunder intend to apply for certificates under the terms 

of section 10 of the Trading Act (No. 6 of 1966).

SEROWE.

Name and Address Type of Licence Location Council Date of 
hearing

Western Trading Wholesale Mogoditshane Kweneng District 20.10.77
Co. (Pty.) Ltd., 
c/o Kirby, Helfer and 
Khama,
P.O. Box 882, 
GABORONE.

Council

Western Trading General Trading Mogoditshane Kweneng District 20.10.77
Co. (Pty.) Ltd., 
c/o Kirby, Helfer and 
Khama,
P.O. Box 882, 
GABORONE.

Council

E.L. Setshwaelo, Restaurant Ramotswa South East District 26. 9.77
P.O. Box 51, 
GABORONE.

Council

T. Prins, Petrol Filling Hukuntsi Kgalagadi District 8.11.77
P.O. Box 48, 
HUKUNTSI.

Station Council

G. Makgetho, Fresh Produce Selebi-Phikwe Selebi-Phikwe Town 28. 9.77
P.O. Box 168, 
SELEBI-PHIKWE.

Council

B.C. Molebatsi, General Trading Monatala Central District 28. 10.77
P.O. Box 50, 
PALAPYE.

Council

G.S. Goepamang, Restaurant Topisi Central District 28.10.77
P.O. Box 100, Council

Any person objecting to the grant of such certificate(s) should, within 7 days of the second publication of 
this/these notice(s), give notice in writing to the said council of his intention to oppose such application and 
state the grounds upon which his objection is based.
Second Publication

Hawkers/Street Vendors Licences
Notice is hereby given that the undersigned intend to apply for Licences in terms of Bye-Laws 5 and 8 of 

the Gaborone Hawking and Street Vending Bye-Laws, 1977, to obtain a Hawker’s Licence/Street Vendor’s 
Licence in respect of areas within the Gaborone Township -

GABORONE.

Name and Address Place (s) where Licence(s) 
Applied for

Council Date of 
hearing

OJ. Sebonego, 
P.O. Box 162, 
GABORONE.

Old Naledi Gaborone Town 
Council

12.10.77

K. Phometsi, 
P.O. Box 1093, 
GABORONE.

Old Naledi Gaborone Town 
Council

12.10.77

A.S. Motlhabane, New Naledi, Bontleng and Gaborone Town 12.10.77
P/Bag 940, 
GABORONE.

and Extension 14 Council

R. Daniel, 
P.O. Box 866, 
GABORONE.

Bontleng Gaborone Town 
Council

12.10.77

B. ZlKHALE,
P.O. Box 79,

Bontleng Gaborone Town 
Council

12.10.77
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Any person objecting to the grant of such certificate(s) should, within 7 days of the second publication of 
this/these notice(s) give notice in writing to the said Council of his intention to oppose such application and 
state the grounds upon which his objection is based.

S. Mosweu, White City, Bontleng and Gaborone Town 12.10.77
P.O. Box 48, Tshwaragano Council

GABORONE.
J. Gaborekwe, Village and Government Gaborone Town 12.10.77
P.O. Box 1259, Premises Council

GABORONE.

Second Publication

Hawker’s Licence
Notice is hereby given that the undersigned intend to apply for a certificate in terms of Bye-Law 8 of the 

Hawking (Model) Bye-Laws, 1967, to obtain a Hawkers Licence.

MOLEPOLOLE.

Name and Address Place(s) where Licence(s) 
Applied Jar

District Council Date oj 
hearing

J. Matimpane, 
P.O. Box 13, 
GABORONE.

Kgale South East District 
Council

26. 9.77

O. Leseane,
P. O. Box 171, 
GABORONE.

Bokaa, Morwa, Odi, Modipane 
AND DlKWIDIDl

Kgatleng District 
Council

28.10.77

L. Tsheole,
P.O. Box 185, 
MOCHUDI.

Mochudi, Morwa and 
Phaphane

Kgatleng District 
Council

28.10.77

A. Ngakane, 
P.O. Box 121, 
KANYE.

Gamajaalela, Galonakana, 
Gatampa and Machana

Southern District 
Council

28.10.77

K. Mareetsile,
P.O. Box 223, 
KANYE.

Matshaneng, Motsentshe,
Gamajaalela, Gatampa, 
Magweriapitse and 
Galonakana

Southern District 
Council

28.10.77

K. Ramogau, 
P.O. Box 458, 
KANYE.

Kanye and Mosi Southern District 
Council

28.10.77

R. Tshekoetsile, 
P.O. Box 36, 
KANYE.

Ranaka, Kgomokasitwa, 
Ntlhantlhe, Molapowabojang 
and Kanye

Southern District 
Council

28.10.77

K. Mmapadi,
P/Bag 5,
MABUTSANE.

Jia, Khaiwa, Majana, Kokong 
and Mabutsane

Southern District 
Council

28.10.77

L. Pule,
P.O. Box 172, 
KANYE.

JWANENG, MaDIGE, 
Gamokweleo, Mmalore, 
Ngane, Pitseng, Naledi Lands, 
Ditojana, Sega, Seherelela, 
Moselebe Lands and 
Gasegwagwa

Southern District 
Council

28.10.77

B. Ntshotlanc, 
P.O. Box 400, 
LOBATSE.

Dilokwana, Mopuelo, 
Makapane, Gamoitlhabanedi 
AND MoSHANENG

Southern District 
Council

28.10.77

l.N. Garebakwena, 
P.O. Box 140, 
MOLEPOLOLE.

Mokgatsha-wa-Lerobe,
Motho-le-Ngwana,
Makeemetswe, Letoroko and 
Ga-Morwaagae

Kweneng District 
Council

20.10.77

M. Bolele,
P.O. Box 128, 
MOLEPOLOLE.

NgWARE, DlNONYANE AND 
AND DlPHUDUHUDU

Kweneng District 
Council

20.10.77

O. Sebetia,
P. O. Box 175,

Banakgatlanyane, Bollakgomo, 
Masebosebo and Mmasejapeo

Kweneng District 
Council

20.10.77
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Private Bag 1, 
BOBONONG.

G. Thupayagale, Sehidike, Mmite, Senthane, Central District 28.10.77
P.O. Kalamare, 
via MAHALAPYE.

Rakabeswa, Bonanotshi and 
Mmanakalengwe

Council

I. Makome, 
P.O. Box 273, 
FRANCISTOWN.

Mathangwane Village, 
Mosope, Mokwibilo, Dzidzipa, 
Tsarutsaru and Mmea

Central District 
Council

28.10.77

A. Sandakazana, 
P.O. Box 273, 
FRANCISTOWN.

Mathangwane Lands, 
Kgoronyane Cattle Post, 
Dzidzipa and Moke Cattle Post

Central District 
Council

28.10.77

N. Kgoboki,
P.O. Box 207, 
SELEBI-PHIKWE.

Bobonong (Mosalakwane) 
Kweneng, Maiswe, Tsebanana 
and Gamakala

Central District 
Council

28.10.77

M. Kedikilwe,
P.O. Box 9,
Sebina, 
via FRANCISTOWN.

Nshakashogwe Cattle Posts, 
Kombani Lands, Maotlakgang, 
Lands, Kutamogoree Cattle 
Post, Mosetse Lands and 
Cattle Posts

Central District 
Council

28.10.77

B.C. Dijeng, 
P.O. Box +33, 
SEROWE.

Tsarutsaru, Mokoko, Mmeya, 
Dibi and Gutsha

Central District 
Council

28.10.77

M. Tsogwane, 
P.O. Box 31, 
ORAPA.

Dorokae, Tshatshamo, Mothupe 
Lands, Motopi Cattle Posts, 
Dimbo Cattle Posts and 
Tsodobe

Central District 
Council

28.10.77

J. Galetlolwe, 
P.O. Box 157, 
MAHALAPYE.

Kgarangwa, Kidikilwe, 
Kgobotwane, Patikwane, 
Mmamasiloanoke, Mmita,
Mowana, Sehidike, Mmamoeletsi 
Nkgorotswane, Rangojana and 
Rakabeswa

Central District 
Council

28.10.77

M. Setaelo, 
Mathangwane Village, 
P.O. FRANCISTOWN.

Molwane, Makwa, Dimaje and 
Bolelathaga Cattle Posts

Central District 
Council

28.10.77

I. Thapisa,
P.O. Box 273, 
FRANCISTOWN.

Maobe, Tlhakotse, Lekoba and 
Bonwantshe (Cattle Posts and 
Lands)

Central District 
Council

28.10.77

W. Kgaloshi, 
Molalatau Co-op.,

Seboo, Thune, Maikwane and 
and Mamoeledi

Central District 
Council

28.10.77

Any person objecting to the grant of such certificate(s) should, within 7 days of the second publication of 
this/these notice(s), give notice in writing to the said council of his intention to oppose such application and 
state the grounds upon which his objection is based.

Second Publication

Transfers
Notice is hereby given that the undersigned intend to apply for a certificate in terms of Section 10 of the 

Trading Act. 1966 (No 6 of 1966’ to obtain a transfer of licence.
A transfer of a General Trading Licence in respect of the premises situated at Hukuntsi and that the 
Kgalagadi District Council has determined that the application shall be heard by the Licensing Authority 
on the 8th November, 1977.

T. Prins, P.O. Box 48, HUKUNTSI
A transfer of a Small General Tr ading Licence in respect of the premises situated at Maaloso Trading 
Store, Tonota and that the Central District Council has determined that the application shall be heard 
by the Licensing Authority on the 28th October, 1977.

E.S. Pillar, P.O. Box 81, TONOTA.
A transfer of a General Tr ading Licence in respect of the premises situated at Central Store and that the 
Central District Council has determined that the application shall be heard by the Licensing Authority 
on the 28th October, 1977.

C.C.E.J. van Vuuren, c/o Minchin and Kelly, P.O. Box 101, GABORONE.
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Any person objecting to the grant of such certificate should, within 7 days of the second publication of this 
notice, give notice in writing to the said Council of his intention to oppose such application and state the 
grounds upon which his objection is based.

Second Publication

Notice of Intention to Transfer a Trading Licence
Notice is hereby given in terms of section 25 (1) of the Trading Act, 1966, that I, Bagopi Sedombo, have 

disposed of my entire interest in Maaloso Trading Store carrying on the business of Small General Trading 
to Ephraim S. Pillar who will continue to trade at the same address and under the same style.

B. Sedombo, P.O. Box 30, TONOTA.
Second Publication

Disposal of Business
Notice is hereby given in terms of section 28 (1) of the Trading Act, 1960 that CEDCOM (PROPRIET­

ARY) LIMITED intends disposing*of its General Trading business known as CENTRAL STORE, carried 
on at MAHALAPYE, to C.C.E.J. van VUUREN.

C.C.EJ. van Vuure^j, c/o Michin and Kelly, P.O. Box 101, GABORONE.
Second Publication

Lobatse Town Council - Tender No. 9/77
Lobatse Town Council invites tenders for the supply and delivery of a vacuum tanker. The tank must have 

a capacity of 6 000 - 8 0001. and must be mounted on a chassis with a single rear-axle.
Closing date: 17th October, 1977, 1.00 p.m. Tenders have to be sent in a plain, sealed envelope marked 

“Tender No. tylT' to the Town Clerk, P.O. Box 27, Lobatse.
Lobatse Town Council does not bind itself to accept the lowest or any tender.

B. Czech, 
for Acting Toivn Clerk.

Second Publication

Lobatse Town Council - Tender No. 10/77
Lobatse Town Council invites tenders for the supply of school books and equipment. Closing date: 17th 

October, 1977, 1.00 p.m. A detailed list of the requirements can be obtained from the Town Clerk, Lobatse 
Town Council, P.O. Box 27, Lobatse.

B. Czech, 
Second Publication for Town Clerk-

Kgalagadi District — Tender No. 9 of 1977
SUPPLY OF SCHOLAR’S BOOKS AND STATIONERY

Tenders are invited for the supply of Scholars’ books and stationery for 1978.
Detailed list of requirements may be obtained from the undersigned. Tenders must be in plain sealed 

envelopes marked “Tender No. 9 of 1977 for Scholars’ Books and Stationery”.
All tenders must be in the hands of the Administrative Secretary (Education), Kgalagadi District Council, 

P.O. Box 2, Tsabong, not later than Friday 28th October, 1977.
Council does not bind itself to accept the lowest or any tender nor will it assign any reason for the accept­

ance or refusal of any tender.
W.S. Difele,

Administrative Secretary,(Education). 
Second Publication
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Licences
Notice is hereby given that the persons specified hereunder intend to apply for certificates under the terms 

of section 10 of the Trading Act (No. 6 of 1966).
Name and Address Type of Licence Location Council Date of 

hearing

E. Mokgaotsane, 
P.O. Box 48, 
GABORONE.

Filling Station Ramotswa (Seuwane) South East District 
Council

Speciality

Merab Ally, 
c/o Kirby, Helfer and 
Khama,
P.O. Box 882, 
GABORONE.

Speciality.
(to sell Electrical 
Appliances, Gas, 
Hardware and 
Ancilliary Products)

L.K. Thito,
P.O. Box 8, 
OTSE.

Restaurant

R.R.. Moirwagale, 
c/o Kirby, Helfer and 
Khama,
P.O. Box 882, 
GABORONE.

Restaurant and
TAKE-AWAY

N.M. Montshioa,
P.O. Box 1237, 
GABORONE.

Fresh Produce

S.I. Maswabi,
P.O. Box 12, 
RAMOTSWA.

Fresh Produce

S.I. Maswabi, 
P.O. Box 12, 
RAMOTSWA.

Small General
Trading

W. Babish, 
Kalkfontein Village, 
Private Bag 6, 
GHANZI.

General Trading

N.J. Morris,
P.O. Box 206, 
PALAPYE.

Fruit Shop

D.L. Nare,
P.O. Box 200, 
PALAPYE.

Small General
Trading

Plot No. 687

Lot 5395
Extension 15

Gaborone Town 
Council

12.10.77

Otse South East District
Council

28.10.77

Lot 5178, Extension
14

Gaborone Town 
Council

12.10.77

Lot 5184 Extension
14

Gaborone Town
Council

12.10.77

SlGA South East District 
Council

28.10.77

SlGA South East District
Council

28.10.77

Kalkfontein Ghanzi District
Council

25.10.77

Palapye Business 
Centre

Central District
Council

28.10.77

Central District
Council

28.10.77

S.M. PODIEPHATSHWA,
P.O. Box 58, 
FRANCISTOWN.
M. Phiri,
P.O. Box 532, 
SEROWE.
P. Motswenyane,
P.O. Box 25, 
SELEBI-PHIKWE.

General Trading

Drug Store

Mashoro

The Mall, 
Selebi-Phikwe

Francistown Town 13.10.77 
Council

Central District
Council

Selebi-Phikwe Town
Council

28.10.77

26.10.77

Any person objecting to the grant of such certificate(s) should, within 14 days of the first publication of 
this/these notice(s), give notice in writing to the said council of his intention to oppose such application and 
state the grounds upon which his objection is based.

First Publication
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Hawker’s Licences
Notice is hereby given that the undersigned intend to apply for a certificate in terms of Bye-Law 8 of the

Hawking (Model) Bye-Laws, 1967, to obtain a Hawkers Licence.
_\ame and Address Placets) where Licence(s) 

Applied for
District Council Date of 

hearing

Z. Mothoki, 
P.O. Box 20, 
RAMOTSWA.

Mogobane, Otse and Ramotswa 
Village

South East District 
Council

28.10.77

O. Ngwenya,
P. O. Box 111, 
SELEBI-PHIKWE.

Ghanzi Commonage, D’kar, 
Kalkfontein, Karakobisi, 
Kanagas, Charles Hill, 
Makunda, Kule and Nojane

Ghanzi District
Council

25.10.77

G. Thabalake, 
P.O. Box 138, 
MOLEPOLOLE.

Mmamarobole, Phiring, Borite, 
Malopane and Ramotimane

Kweneng District 
Council

20.10.77

K.T. Sebogiso, 
c/o Mr Koboyangaka, 
Private Bag 5, 
MOLEPOLOLE.

Kolobeng and Metsjmotlhabe Kweneng District 
Council

20.10.77

G. Pelekekae, 
c/o P/Bag 12, 
LOBATSE.

Phala, Seferelela, Lobutse, 
Lefoko, Dikokwana, Kuwe and 
Mokhomma

Southern District
Council

28.10.77

S.M. Ramonko, 
P.O. Box 103, 
LOBATSE.

Digawana, Gatwane, Lorwana, 
Mogojogojwe, Tlaakgama and 
Lobatse

Southern District 
Council

28.10.77

P.J. Bahuma, 
P.O. Box 371, 
LOBATSE.

MOSI AND TSWAANENG Southern District 
Council

28.10.77

S.M. Raditau,
P.O. Box 3, 
SELEBI-PHIKWE.

Mahalapye Lands and Cattle 
Post, Tobela, Lephepe, Konoa, 
Thakadiawa, Kalamare Lands, 
Mmite, Modiane, Mhate, 
Bonwanotshi and Mmutlane 
Lands

Central District 
Council

28.10.77

O. Mogwai,
P. O. Box 35, 
TUTUME.

Mashuchi, Makgubula, 
Mpesoko, Kwadiba, Matisha, 
Linuniyane and Turibe

Central District 
Council

28.10.77

A.L. Manwedi,
P.O. Box 3,
SELEBI-PHIKWE.

Mosetse, Dukwi, Matsitama, 
Nata, Tshwaane, Semowane, 
Kamangau, Sematlaphiri, 
Lesotho and Choba Villages

Central District 
Council

28.10.77

A. Kgosiyang, 
Maunatlala Village, 
P.O. PALAPYE.

Tlhakadiawa Lands, 
Dikgathong Cattle Post, 
Lotsane and Letsibogo Ranch

Central District 
Council

28.10.77

G. Keoreng,
Gweta Village,
P/Bag,
via FRANCISTOWN

Kaedobe, Maotomabe, Morula, 
Xamodaba, Chokatsha, Xaa 
AND BoiTUMELO

Central District 
Council

28.10.77

T.M. Moloko, 
P.O. Box 210, 
SELEBI-PHIKWE.

Bobonong, Molalatau, 
Semolale, Mathatane 
AND GoBAJANGWE

Central District 
Council

28.10.77

J. Dikganc, 
Tsetsebye Village, 
P.O. Box 2, 
PALAPYE.

Tsetsebye, Sememedi, 
Matlhakoleng, Mmaikowane, 
Lephale, Moletemane, 
Molejane and Selepye

Central District 
Council

28.10.77

Any person objecting to the grant of such certificate(s) should, within 14 days of the first publication of 
this/these notice(s), give notice in writing to the said council of his'intention to oppose such application and 
state the grounds upon which his objection is based.

First Publication
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Hawkers/Street Vendors Licences
Notice is hereby given that the undersigned intend to apply for Licences in terms of Bye-Laws 5 and 8 of 

the Gaborone Hawking and Street Vending Bye-Laws, 1977, to obtain a Hawker’s Licence/Street Vendor’s 
Licence in respect of areas within the Gaborone Township -
Name and Address Place(s) where Licence(s) 

Applied for
CounciZ Date of 

hearing

P.Z. Mugadzaweta, 
P.O. Box 852, 
GABORONE.

Gaborone, Village and 
and Bontleng

Gaborone Town
Council

12.10.77

J. Sekai, 
P.O. Box 103, 
LOBATSE.

Village, Bontleng, White City, 
Broadhurst, Extensions 10 and 
14, New and Old Naledi

Gaborone Town
Council

12.10.77

R. Mokgwaripe,
P.O. Box 135, 
GABORONE.

Old Naledi Gaborone Town 
Council

12.10.77

N. Monametsi,
P.O. Box 1044, 
GABORONE.

New and Old Naledi, White 
City, Bontleng, New Canada, 
Village, Ext. 2 and 14

Gaborone Town 
Council

12.10.77

P. Molelu, 
P.O. Box 942, 
GABORONE.

Broadhurst, Bontleng, New 
and Old Naledi, Extensions 13, 
14 (New Plots), 15 and 19

Gaborone Town 
Council

12.10.77

M. Mezi, 
P.O. Box 75, 
GABORONE.

Ext. 14 Gaborone Town 
Council

12.10.77

B. Nkatso,
Ramona Bakery and Cafe. 
GABORONE.

Old Naledi Gaborone Town 
Council

12.10.77

B. Manuel, 
c/o Beef Botswana,
P.O. Box 2, 
GABORONE.

Broadhurst, Station, Industrial Gaborone Town 
Sites, Old and New Naledi, Council
Village, Airport, Extensions
2, 4, 9 AND 1 1

12.10. 77

N. Ookeditse, 
P.O. Box 48, 
GABORONE.

White City, Bontleng, New 
and Old Naledi

Gaborone Town 
Council

12.10.7.7

T. Tlou, 
Old Naledi,

Old Naledi Bus Stop Gaborone Town 
Council

12.10.77

GABORONE.
Any person objecting to the grant of such ccrtificatc(s) should, within 14 days of the first publication of 

this/these notice(s), give notice in writing to the appropriate council of his intention to oppose such 
application and state the grounds upon which his objection is based.
First Publication

Transfers
Notice is hereby given that the undersigned intend to apply for a certificate in terms of Section 10 of the 

Trading Act, 1966 (No. 6 of 1966) to obtain a transfer of licence.
A transfer of Existing Trading Licence from Stand No.’s 271/272, Haskins Street to the premises 
situated at Stand No.’s 1538/1539 and that the Francistown Town Council has determined that the 
application shall be heard by the Licensing Authority on the 13th October, 1977.

G. De Fellipo, P.O. Box 202, FRANCISTOWN.
A transfer of a General Trading Licence in respect of premises situated at Plot 479 Haskins Street 
and that the Francistown Town Council has determined that the application shall be heard by the 
Licensing Authority on the 10th November, 1977.
Z. & M.K. Desai, c/o J.Z. Mosojane and Partners, Applicants’ Attorneys, P.O. Box 484, FRANCISTOWN. 

A transfer of a Restaurant Licence into Small General Trading Licence in respect of the premises 
situated at Tlhabala and that the Central District Council has determined that the application shall be 
heard by the Licensing Authority on the 28th October, 1977.

P.B. Radisebo, Tlhabala Restaurant* Private Bag 3, SEROWE.
Any person objecting to the grant of such ccrtificate(s) should, within 14 days of the first publication of 

this/these noticc(s), give notice in writing to the appropriate council of his intention to oppose such 
application and state the grounds upon which his objection is based.
First Publication
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Notice of Intention to Transfer a Trading Licence
Notice is hereby given in terms of section 25 (1) of the Trading Act, 1966 that Levitt Bros. (Pty.) Ltd. have 

disposed of their entire interest in Levitt Bros. Store carrying on the business of General Trading at Plot 479 
Haskins Street, Francistown, to Z. Desai (Mrs) and M.K. Desai of Francistown who will continue to trade at 
the same address and under the name and style of Fashion World.

J.Z. Mosojane and Partners, Attorneys for the Parties, 5 Africa House, P.O. Box 484, FRANCISTOWN.

First Publication

Kgatleng District Council - Tender No. 7 of 1977
Kgatleng District Council invites tenders for the supply of scholars’ books and stationery (Primary). 

Specifications can be obtained from the Council Secretary on request. Tenders have to be sent in plain sealed 
envelopes marked “Tender No. 7 of 1977 Scholars’ Books and Stationery” to Council Secretary, P.O. Box 
378, Mochudi not later than 4.30 p.m. 14th October, 1977.

Council does not bind itself to accept the lowest or any tender.
M. Malikongwa, 

for Council Secretary.

Kgatleng District Council — Tender No. 8 of 1977
Tenders are invited by this council for the construction of:

Three Classroom Block, Plan No. XX/E/1192/B at Makgophana in Mochudi.
Three Pit Latrines, Plan No. XX/P/2065 at Makgophana in Mochudi
Four Classroom Block, Plan No. XX/E/1192/B at Boseja in Mochudi.
Three Pit Latrines, Plan No. XX/P/2065 at Boseja in Mochudi.
One Administration Block, Plan No. XX/E/1224 at Boseja in Mochudi.
One Primary School Storeroom Kitchen, Plan No. XX/E/1161 Type C at Boseja in Mochudi.

Tenderers must submit detailed estimates for the labour charges to construct above buildings. The supply of 
of materials (including gravel, water and transport) should also be tendered for.

Tenderers must specify their potential starting date and tht length of time needed to complete the above 
projects.

Information, plans and specifications can be obtained from the Kgatleng Works Office in Mochudi.
Tenders should be sent to the Secretary, P.O. Box 378, Mochudi in sealed envelopes clearly marked 

“Tender No. 8 of 1977” and must be delivered to the Secretary not later than 4.30 p.m. on the 14th October, 
1977.

This Council does not bind itself to accept the lowest or any bid.

B.S.  Pheto, 
First Publication f°r Council Secretary.

Kgatleng District Council - Tender No. 9 of 1977
Tenders are invited by this Council for the Construction of:

One Clinic CIA, Plan No. XX/L6/1612/4A in Mochudi.
One Health Post Hpl, Plan No. XX/L6/1612/2 with a pit latrine, Plan No. XX/P/2064 at Rasesa Village.
One Health Post Hpl, Plan No. XX/1612/2 with a pit latrine, Plan No. XX/P/2064 at Morwa Village.

Tenderers must submit detailed estimates for the labour charges to construct above buildings. The supply 
of materials (including gravel, water and transport) should also be tendered for.

Tenderers must specify their potential starting date and the length of time needed to complete the above 
projects.

Information, plans and specifications can be obtained from the Kgatleng Works Office in Mochudi.
Tenders should be sent to the Secretary, P.O. Box 378, Mochudi in sealed envelopes clearly marked 

“Tender No. 9 of 1977”, and must be delivered to the Secretary not later than 4.30 p.m. on the 14th October, 
1977.

This Council does not bind itself to accept the lowest or any bid.
B.S.  Pheto, 

First Publication for Council Secretary.
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The Alternative of Court Action is the Likelihood to 
be used to recover rates by Lobatse Town Council

After many approaches and reminders to the Lobatse Ratepayers regarding payment of rates, Lobatse 
Town Council, as at the meeting of 27th July, 1977, has made a resolution in terms of sections 78 and 79 
of the Town Council Regulations that ail defaulters who will not have paid their rates as at the 1st November, 
1977, should be taken to Court.

Notice is hereby given that all ratepayers who are not up to date with their payments should have them paid 
on or before the 31st October, 1977. Failure to do so will lead to Council taking them to Court without any 
further approach or warning. Already those owing over Pl 000 have had their names registered in the High 
Court for action.”

L.L.  Mabua, 
First Publication Town Clerk.

have executed a Notarial Exclusion of Community of Property in terms of the Married Persons Property Act, 
as amended.

Married Persons Property Act
Notice is hereby given that

MPHOENG TSHEKEDI KHAMA 
and

DOREEN CILLA KHAMA

All persons having objections thereto must lodge same with the Registrar of Deeds for Botswana at Gabo­
rone within 28 days of the date hereof after which this Deed will be submitted to the Registrar of Deeds for 
Botswana at Gaborone for the registration of the same.

P.O. Box 882 and 170, 
Cooperative House, 
The Mall, 
GABORONE.

Kirby, Helfer and Khama, 
Attorneys for the Parties.

IN THE COURT OF THE
THE REPUBLIC OF BOTSWANA

Cause No. 91 o/T977
In the matter between:

SULAIMAN PELWAN Applicant
and

ZAHAV ENTERPRISES (PTY.) LTD. Respondent

PROVISIONAL WINDING-UP ORDER

Before the Honourable Mr Justice Edwards at Lobatse on the 26th day of August, 1977.
UPON reading the Petition filed herein and upon hearing Mr Attorney Norman Kades for the Petitioner. 
IT IS ORDERED TH A T:
(1) A Rule Nisi do issue calling upon all persons interested to show cause if any, to this Honourable Court 

sitting at Lobatse on Friday the 7th day of October, 1977 at 10 a.m. why the abovenamed Respondent 
should not be wound up in terms of the Companies Proclamation (Cap. 42:01).

(2) This Rule Nisi operate as a Provisional Winding-Up Order.
(3) Service of this Rule Nisi be effected: —

(a) Upon the Respondent at its Registered Office by the Deputy Sheriff.
(b) By publication once only in the Government Gazette and in the Botswana Daily News.
(c) By prepaid registered post on all known creditors of the Respondent.

(4) Costs of this application be costs in the Winding-Up.
BY THE COURT

A. Nithianandan, 
Registrar.
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IN THE HIGH COURT OF
THE REPUBLIC OF BOTSWANA
HELD AT LOBATSE

In the matter between: 
MAURICE WILLIAM SANDERS

and
M.B. (PROPRIETARY) LIMITED

Civil Cause No. 93 of 1977

Petitioner

Respondent

ORDER

Before the Honourable Mr Justice J.B. Edwards on Friday the 2nd September, 1977.
UPON HEARING Mr Attorney Kades for the Petitioner, having read the documents as filed on record and 

heard evidence —
IT IS ORDERED:

1. That the Respondent company be and is hereby placed provisionally under judicial management in terms 
of Section 265 of the Companies Proclation Chapter 42:01.

2. That while this order is in force the company be under the management, subject to the supervision of the 
court of a provisional judicial manager or managers appointed by the Master.

3. That as from this date any other person or persons vested with the management of the company’s affairs be 
divested thereof.

4. That the provisional manager or managers discharge the duties prescribed by Section 268 of the Com­
panies Proclamation Chapter 42:01.

5. That the provisional judicial manager or managers appointed by the Master be empowered without the 
authority of the shareholders but subject to the authority of creditors and the Master to borrow moneys 
with or without security on behalf of the said company for the purpose of paying essential running 
expenditure in and about the business of the said company, including salaries, wages and rental for 
business premises required by the said company and to pledge the credit of the said company for any goods 
or services required.

6. That while the company is under judicial management all actions, proceedings, the execution of all writs, 
summonses and other processes against the company be stayed and be not proceeded with without the 
leave of this court being had an obtained.

7. That the rate of remuneration of the provisional judicial manager or managers be fixed by the Master in 
accordance with the services rendered and disbursements incurred, or should the Master so request the 
said rate of remuneration shall be fixed by the court after the Master has reported thereon.

8. That the judicial manager or managers shall furnish to the satisfaction of the Master for the due perform­
ance of his /their duties as such and shall choose some domicilium citandi et executandi with Botswana.

9. That the judicial manager or managers shall as soon as practicable unless with the consent of the Master 
not later than one month and in any case not later than three months after the date of his/their assumption 
of management, and at intervals of three months thereafter, submit to a meeting of the company, to a 
meeting of the creditors of the company and to the Master, a report showing the assets and liabilities of the 
company, its debts and obligations, as verified by the auditors of the company, and such other 
information as may be necessary to enable the Master and the members and the creditors to become fully 
acquainted with the company's position.

10. That a rule nisi do issue calling upon all persons concerned to appear and to show cause if any to this 
court at 10 a.m. on the 7th day of October, 1977
(a) Why a final judicial management order should not be granted;
(A) Why the following directions should not be included in the final order:

(i) That the management of the company shall vest subject to the supervision of the court in the final 
judicial manager or managers;

(ii) That the provisional judicial manager or managers shall forthwith hand over all matters and 
account for his or their administration of the property, business and affairs of the company to the 
final judicial manager or managers;

(iii) That the provisional judicial manager or managers be discharged from their duties, but that he or 
they remain obliged to account to the final judicial manager or managers as aforesaid and to the 
Master;

(iv) That the provisions of paragraphs 5 to 9 should apply mutatis mutandis;
(v) That the final judicial manager or managers discharge the duties prescribed by Section 268 of 

the Companies Proclamation Chapter 42:01.
(c) And why the costs of this application should not be costs in the judicial management.
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11. That this order be published forthwith in each of the Government Gazette and the Botswana Daily News.
12. That service of this order be effected upon the Respondent company at its registered office.
13. That service of this order be effected upon all known creditors of the Respondent by prepaid registered 

post.

BY ORDER OF THE COURT
A. Nithianandan, 

Registrar.

Change of Name
Notice is hereby given that Elba Transport (Pty.) Ltd. will make application to the Registrar of Companies 

in terms of section 22 (1) of the Companies Act, Cap. 42:01, not less than fourteen days after publication of 
this advertisement for his written approval to change the name of the Company to Transport Internationale 
(Botswana) (Pty.) Ltd.

Execsec (Pty.) Ltd.,
for and on behalf of Elba Transport (Pty.) Ltd.

Change of Name
In terms of section 22 (1) of the Companies Act, notice is hereby given that application will be made to the 

to the Registrar of Companies, within 14 days of this publication, for approval of the Change of Name from 
Continental Traders (Pty.) Ltd. to Continental Motors (Pty.) Ltd.

S.L. Clark,
Secretary,

Bechuanaland Board of Executors Limited.

Republic of Botswana - Tender No. TB 9/8/5/77-78

SUPPLY OF VEHICLE CANOPIES (FIBRE-GLASS)
Tenders are invited for the supply of Fibre-glass canopies for fitment to various “pick-up” type vehicles 

presently operated by, or being delivered to, the Botswana Government.
If prices are quoted in any currency other than PULA, a statement of the rate of exchange on conversion to 

PULA should be included, together with an undertaking as to the period of validity of such rate of exchange.
Prices quoted F.O.R. GABORONE should be accompanied by a statement detailing the proportion of 

such price which relates to transport ex works.
The lowest, or any bid will not necessarily be accepted.
Tenders must reach the Secretary, Central Tender Board, Private Bag 0058, Gaborone either by post or by 

hand in a sealed envelope marked “TB 9/8/5/77-78 - Vehicle Canopies” not later than 0900 hrs on 12th 
October, 1977. Proof of posting before the due date will not allow for consideration of tenders received after 
the due date.

Bona fide tenderers may obtain a list of the various types ot vehicles for which canopies may be required, 
together with a general specification for the construction lay-out and fittings expected, on application to the 
General .Manager, Central Transport Organisation.

Any further information regarding this tender may be obtained from the Fleet Administration Manager,
C.T.O.,  P.O. Box 517, Gaborone.

K.K. Semelamela, 
Secretary, Central Tender Board.



Sale of Firearms and Ammunition - TB 2/8/3/77-78
PROVISIONAL RESULTS

It is hereby notified for general information that the following arms and ammunition have been provisionally awarded to the highest bidders as shown 
below. Owing to the large number of bids received, Central Fender Board would allow 21 days from the date of this publication for any persons wishing to 
contest the provisional results to make such a claim to the Secretary or Assistant Superintendent P. Marathe, Tel. No. Gaborone 5241.

FIREARMS

Item ,\'o. Calibre . Vumber Tender .\o. Hid Successful Tenderer
1. .375 Sako Rifle 106834 161 C P75O,OO R.S. Riggs, Box 185, Francistown
2. .30 Remington Rifle 21357 28 C P310,00 G.G. Van Staden, Box 987, Gaborone
3. 30/06 Netro Proof Rifle 4 47 A P426.99 G. Gakelona, Box 570, Gaborone
4. .303 Greener Rifle S.73O6-RC 4832 209 A Pl 70,00 G. Makgotho, Box 71, Maun
5. .303 Enfield Rifle 3528 19 A Pl 00,99 M. Makgetla, Khakhia Village, P/Bag Kanye
6. .303 M.K. 4 Rifle 3606517. 206 A 1’355,00 P.L. Kirby, Box 180, Selebi-Phikwe
7. .303 BSA Co. Rifle IO52-A. 17176 29 A P33O.OO James R. Molatole, Box 80, Maun
8. .303 BSA Go. Rifle 51841 83 B P 80,00 BJ. Matlapeng, Box 358, Mochudi
9. .303 BSA Co. Rifle 4 162 45 B PI00.99 G. Okaile, Box 1082, Gaborone

10. .303 BSA Go. Rifle 33914-63293 200 B 1’250,00 M. Kalantle, Tshane Village, Box 29, Hukuntsi
11. .303 Rifle 3871-130068-BPJ. 21903 82 A P200.00 C.M.O. Molatole, Box 2, Tshabong
12. .303 Netro Rifle 2050. BOLT. 79780 44 A P200.00 Elias K. Nkwane, Box 516, Gaborone
13. .303 Enfield Rifle 31041 274 C 1’250,00 M.M. Talape, c/o Gaobewe, Box 536, Gaborone
14. .303 BSA Co. Rifle 85026 267 C P300.90 Jaruta Kerena, Box 44, Maun
15. .303 Enfield Rifle 656 94 A P300,00 J.R. Me Donald, P/Bag 003, Gaborone
16. .303 Rifle 77'6 146 C Pl 55.00 M.G. Silas, P/Bag 005, Gaborone
17. .303 BSA Co. Rifle 399 217 C P300.00 F. German, Box 224, Maun
18. .303 BSA Co. Rifle G.95869 98 C P440.00 W. Mokgabo, Box 64, Maun
19. .303 Rifle BPX 6003 65 B P200.00 Moopi Mabe, Box 64, Maun
20. .303 Rifle 51 16 180 B P225.OO L.O. Saidoo, Box 337, Lobatse
21. .303 Rifle 5897 151 B P300.00 J. Kaartzec, Box 35, Tshabong
22. .303 Rifle BSA Co. 1 9326 1 C Pl 70,00 K. Karonkwana, P.O. Sehitwa, via Maun
23. .303 Enfield Rifle 559 2 B Pl 40,05 S.K. Sekgopa, Box 1082, Gaborone
24. .303 Enfield Rifle 5410 32 A P352.00 F. Forembi, Box 64, Maun
25. M/Henry Rifle BPD 59.55 142 C P100,00 Paster E.S. Kwenane, Box 1 14, Maun
26. M/Henry Rifle - 107 B P 10,00 D.R. Harris, Box 1082, Gaborone
27. M/Henry Rifle BPB 1688 13 A P 15,00 H.J. Pieters, c/o Station Master, Ramotswa
28. M/Henry Rifle 92 131 B P 23,00 J.W. Duncan, Box 517, Gaborone
29. M/Henry Rifle 27784 36 A P 60,00 N.K. Madikwc, Box 987, Gaborone
30. M/Henry Rifle 9548-6 106 B P 10,00 C. Shields, Box 402, Gaborone
31. M/Henry Rifle G.5769 . 121 B P 23,00 J.W. Duncan, Box 517, Gaborone
32. M/Henry Rifle 4816-1715-19236 160 B P 90,00 M. Mafoko, Box 70, Maun
33. M/Henry Rifle BPK.13 206 B P 20,00 M. Molatole, Box 517, Gaborone



Item No. Calibre Number Tender No.
34. 6.5 mm Rifle UDP.201-2366 183 A
35. 7 mm Rifle 9089-BOLT 790-8369 183 A
36. 7 mm Rifle 18 27 C
37. 7 mm Rifle 3183-BOLT-6660 139 B
38. 7 mm Rifle BPB.4432 98 A
39. 7 mm Rifle 147 BOLT 220 B
40. 7 x 57 mm Rifle LP.210-4325 122 A
41. 7 mm BR Rifle -
42. 7 mm Rifle 5539 141 C
43. 7 mm Rifle 9320 217 C
44. 7 mm Rifle 10272 210 C
45. 7.9 mm Rifle 6731-98 167 C
46. B x 57 mm Rifle 1 76888 77 C
47. 9.3 x 62 mm Rifle 9981 173 C
48. .303 BSA Co. Rifle 19326 BOLT 19326
49. .303 Enfield Rifle 559 BOLT 559 -
50. .303 Rifle 5410
51. .410 Mossberg 110729 59 C
52. .410 Guernica Spain 375-BI130 228 B
53. S/B .410 Bore Fucile Rinfonzate C75499
54. D/B fl 6 Bore Burches Celta 24889 59 C
55. S/B" 12 Bore Winchester 110015 32 A
56. S/B 12-Bore Winchester 135796 180 B
57. S/B 12 Bore BSA Co. Y.B. 9634 193 C
58. S/B 12 Bore H. & Richardson V.32261 24J) C
59. S/B 12 Bore Winchester 1 4.5532 226 C
60. S/B 12 Bore BSA Co. Snipe Y.I). 11517 39 B
61. S/B 12 Bore Iver Johnson BPB 1580 43 A



Bid Successful Tenderer
P201,99 T. Baatshwana, P/Bag 0012, Gaborone 
Pl 77,99 T. Baatshwana, P/Bag 0012, Gaborone
P200,00 A.S. Motlhabane, Box 940, Gaborone
Pl60,00 L.G. Mangadi, Box 4, Ghanzi
Pl20,00 G. Godisamang, Box 145, Serowe
Pl80,00 B.K. Bogosi, Box 87, Gaborone 
P125,10 J. Mathumo, Box 301, Gaborone

Withdrawn by C.A.R., No Rifle
Pl60,75 J.L.T. Mothibamele, Box 26, Ghanzi
P400,00 F.P. German, Box 224, Maun
P345,00 E. Maphanyane, P/Bag 008, Gaborone 
P210,00 B. Makgobi, Box 25, Maun
P52O,OO A.A. Mills, Box 28, Mochudi 
P457,99 G. Gakelona, Box 570, Gaborone

Duplicate of item 22
Duplicate of item 23
Duplicate of item 24

P450,00 H. Leong, Box 133, Gaborone 
Pl 78,59 G.N. Sechele, Box 80, Maun

Withdrawn by C.A.R., wrong calibre 
P400,00 H. Leong, Box 133, Gaborone 
Pl57,00 F. Forembi, Box 64, Maun 
Pl80,00 L.O. Saidoo, Box 337, Lobatse
P200,00 M.K. Sola, Malambakwena School, P.O. Tshesebe 
PI25,00 T.W. Burgess, P/Bag 30, Francistown
Pl 75,00 O.S. Rasool, Box 333, Lobatse
P225,OO J.R Me Donald, P/Bag 003, Gaborone
P200,00 B. Mashabile, c/o Bothongo, Box 1433, Gaborone



Item No. Calibre Quantity
1. .22 Short 250
1. Balance 1086
2. .22 Long 38
3. .22 Fiochi 20
4. .22 Hornet 541
5. .222 75
6. .243 65
7. .25 20 mm 3
8. .250 - 300 14
9. .264 mm 16

10. .303 894
11. .308 271
12. .300 43
13. .375 94
14. .357 2
15. .400 360 mm 2
16. 425 Macinum 6
17. .458 mm 9
18. 6.5 mm 33
19. .7 mm 9
20. 7.62 mm 53
21. ’7.9 mm 7
22. 8. mm 27
23. 8 x 57 mm 38
24. 9.3 mm 30
25. 9.5 mm 4
26. M/Henry 18
27. 12 Boreshots 100
27. 12 Boreshots 100
27. 12 Boreshots 100
27. 12 Boreshots 100
27. Boreshots 100
27. Balance 232
28. 410 Bore 90
29. 20 Bore 4
30. 16 Bore 6
31. 6.35 mm 243
32. 7.65 mm 95



Secretary, Central Tender Board.

AMMUNITION
Tender
151 C

Tenderers
P 2,50 S.A. Hirshfeld, P/Bag 0012, Gaborone 

Tenderers have no arms certificates

-
No Bid

125 B P 25,00 D. Sabuta, Box 534, Tati-Town
— No Bid
— - Tenderer has no arm certificate
— No Bid
- - Tenderers have no arms certificates

»> »» »» •* »> ”
No Bid

161 C PI 12,80 R.S. Riggs, Box 185, Francistown
— No Bid
— No Bid -
— No Bid -
- No Bid -
— Tenderers have no arms certificates
122 A P 2,50 J. Mathumo, Box 301, Gaborone

- Tenderers have no arms certificates

77 G P 20,00
»» >» ”

A.A. Mills, Box 28, Mochudi
34 A P 15,00 K. Simasiku, Martinsdrift, Box 3, Sherwood

- No Bid
- Tenderers have no arms certificates

34 A P 15,00 K. Simasiku, Martinsdrift, Box 3, Sherwood
158 C P 17,00 Rex Tabute, Tshane Village, P/Bag 10, Lobatse.
56 C P 15,00 S.B. Samasasa, Box 3, Letlhakane

134 C P 11,99 M.S. Meraftie, P/Bag 0012, Gaborone
151 C P 12,50 S.A. Hirschfeld, P/Bag 0012, Gaborone
- - Tenderers have no arms certificates

5» >5 »» »»
No Bid

— Tenderers have no arms certificates
- No Bid
- No Bid K.K. Semelamela,


