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Government Notice No. 598 of 1977
BOTSWANA HONOURS ACT
(Cap. 03:06)
Presidential Awards

IT IS HEREBY NOTIFIED for general information that, in exercise of the powers conferred by section 3
of the Botswana Honours Act, His Excellency the President has been pleased to award the following honours —

Presidential Order of Meritorious Service

Monsignor Boniface Tshosa Ratshosa Setlalekgosi
James Mpotokwane
Clarkson Kabelo Matlhaga

Presidential Certificate of Honour

The Late Ratsie Setlhako .

The Late Kegopolwe Gaolaolwe Setilo

Segomotso Ramokolema Pheto ‘
Keagana Mokgadi Kowa

Jubilee Mosimane

Anna Baakile Motswedi (Mrs)

Meshack Maunge

Oabona Arabang Mosime

Simon Setimela

Botswana Police Long Service and Good Conduct Medal =

Bakake Mathibela — Assistant Superintendent of Police
Andrew Segale Pilane - Assistant Superintendent of Police
No. 2429 Inspector Isaac Letsatle

No. 2459 Inspector Gaothaole Modipane °
No. 2427 Sub-Inspector Amogelang Mothibi

No. 2438 Sub-Inspector Edwin Kareng

No. 2421 Sergeant Diphatsa Jackson Ankhoma

No. 2423 Sergeant Lawrence Mompati Baatweng

No. 2434 Sergeant Simon Monaka

No. 2446 Sergeant Moswasi Mongakgotla

No. 2433 Constable Boitshwarelo Nkwane

Botswana Prison Service Medal

Lucas Ramokhuwa — Director of Prisons
Mokeresete Kgotla Sebele — Assistant Superintendent of Prisons

DATED this 14th day of October, 1977. .

P.L. STEENKAMP,
Permanent Secretary,

L2/7/112 1 Office of the President.

Government Notice No. 599 of 1977
CONSTITUTION OF BOTSWANA
Acting Appointment — Permanent Secretary,
Ministry of Mineral Resources and Water Affairs
IN EXERCISE of the powers conferred by section 113 of the Constitution, His Excellency the President
has appointed —
SAMUEL AKUNA MPUCHANE
to act as Permanent Secretary, Ministry of Mineral Resources and Water Affairs, with effect from 10th
October, 1977, to 15th October, 1977 inclusive.
DATED this 11th day of October, 1977.
P.L. STEEXKAMP,
Permanent Secretary,
Office of the President.
L2/7/9t X



Government Notice No. 600 of 1977

CONSTITUTION OF BOTSWANA

Acting Appointment - Permanent Secretary,
Ministry of Finance and Development Planning
IN EXERCISE of the powers conferred by section 113 of the Constitution, His Excellency the President
has appointed —
BENJAMIN IPONENG GASENNELWE

to act as Permanent Secretary, Ministry of Finance and Development Planning, with effect from 10th
October, 1977, to 16th October, 1977, inclusive.

DATED this 12th day of October, 1977.

P.L. STEENKAMP,
Permanent Secretary,
Office of the President.

L2/7/98 X

Government Notice No. 601 of 1977
Acting Appointment - Auditor-General

IT IS HEREBY NOTIFIED for general information that —
JOHN HOWARD WHITFIELD
has been appointed to act as Auditor-General with effect from 12th October, 1977, to 14th November, 1977,
inclusive.
DATED this 14th day of October, 1977.
P.L. STEENKAMP,

Permanent Secretary,
Office of the President.

L2/7/180 11

Government Notice No. 602 of 1977
ELECTORAL ACT
(Cap. 02:07)

Appointment of General Registration Period

IN EXERCISE of the powers conferred by section 7 of the Electoral Act, His Excellency the President
hereby appoints the period between 24th October, 1977, and 4th November, 1977, to be the general regis-
tration period for the constituencies listed in the Schedule.

SCHEDULE

Moshupa

Kanye South

Kanye North

Ngwaketse and Kgalagadi.

DATED this 10th day of October, 1977.

P.L. STEENKAMP,
Permanent Secretary,
Office of the President.

L2/7/63 I
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Government Notice No. 603 of 1977

EDUCATION ACT
(Cap. 58:01)

Application for Change in Establishment of School

IN ACCORDANCE with the provisions of section 17 (3) of the Education Act, it is hereby notified for
general information that the Kgalagadi District Council has made an application for a change in the estab-
lishment of Gakhibana School, Tshabong, in the following respect —

Provision of a Std. VII class for 1978

Any person or body of persons who may wish to object to this application shall lodge in writing with me,
and with the applicant at its address, a statement of his grounds of objection within six weeks of the publication
of this notice.

DATED this 5th day of October, 1977.
D.W. FiNLAY,
Permanent Secretary,
Ministry of Education.
L2/7/87

Government Notice No. 604 of 1977
EDUCATION ACT
(Cap. 58:01)

Application for Change in Establishment of School

IN ACCORDANCE with the provisions of section 17 (3) of the Education Act, it is hereby notified for
general information that the Kgalagadi District Council has made an application for a change in the estab-
lishment of Khuis School, Middlepits, in the following respect —

Provision of a Std. VI class for 1978.

Any person or body of persons who may wish to object to this application shall lodge in writing with me,
and with the applicant at its address, a statement of his grounds of objection within six weeks of the publication
of this notice.

DATED this 5th day of October, 1977.
D.W. FinLAYy,
Permanent Secretary,
Ministry of Education.

L2/7/87

Government Notic: No. 605 of 1977

EDUCATION ACT
(Cap. 58:01)

Application for Change in Establishment of School

IN ACCORDANCE with the provisions of section 17 (3) of the Education Act, it is hereby notified for
general information that the Kgalagadi District Council has made na application for a change in the stablish-
ment of Kisa School, Tshabong, in the following respect —

Provision of a Std. VI class for 1978.

Any person or body of persons who may wish to object to this application shall lodge in writing with me,
and with the applicant at its address, a statement of his grounds of objection within six weeks of the publication
ot his notice.

DATED this 5th day of October, 1977.
D.W. FinavLy,
Permanent Secretary,
Ministry of Education.

L2/7/87



Government Notice No. 606 of 1977

EDUCATION ACT
(Cap. 58:01)

Application for Change in Establishment of School

IN ACCORDANCE with the provisions of section 17 (3) of the Education Act, it is hereby notified for
general information that the Kgatleng District Council has made an application for a change in the establish-
ment of Dikwididi School, Mochudi, in the following respect —

Addition of Standard 3.
Any person or body of persons who may wish to object to this application shall lodge in writing with me,

and with the applicant at its address, a statement of his grounds of objection within six weeks of the publication
of this notice.

DATED this 5th day of October, 1977.
D.W. FinaLy,
Permanent Secretary,
Ministry of Education.

L2/7/87

Government Notice No. 607 of 1977

EDUCATION ACT
(Cap. 58:01)

Application for Change in Establishment of School

IN ACCORDANCE with the provisions of section 17 (3) of the Education Act, it is hereby notified for
general information that the Kgalagadi District Council has made an application for a change i the establish-
ment of Kolonkwaneng School, Tshabong, in the following respect —

Provision for a Std. V11 Class for 1978.
Any person or body of persons who may wish to object to this application shall lodge in writing with me,

and with the applicant at its address, a statement of his grounds of objection within six weeks of the publication
of this notice.

DATED this 5th day of October, 1977.

D.W. FinaLy,
Permanent Secretary,
Ministry of Education.

12/7/87

Government Notice No. 608 of 1977

COMPANIES ACT
(Cap. 42:01)

Notice of Cessation of a Place of Business

IT 1S HEREBY NOTIFY that written notice of cessation of a place of business in Botswana has been
reccived by me, in terms of section 286 (6) of the Companies Act, from the external company listed in the
Schedule and that, unless cause is shown to the contrary, the said external company will be removed from the
register at the expiration of threce months from the date of publication of this notice.

Number Name of Company

1072 Comstock International Limited

DATED this 10th day of October, 1977.
O.R.N. KALABEN,
Acting Registrar of Companies.
L2/7/111 VI
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Government Notice No. 609 of 1977

STOCK, BONDS AND TREASURY BILLS ACT, 1976
(6 of 1976)

TREASURY BILLS REGULATIONS, 1976
(S.I. 143 of 1976}

Treasury Bills - Issue of 14th October, 1977

The Bank of Botswana announce that applications totalling P1 548 000 were received on 13th October,
1977, for the offer of P500 000 Treasury Bills for issue on 14th October, 1977, ata price of 98,28,,.

Applications were scaled down pro rata and applicants received an allotment of about 32,4 of the amount
of Bills applied for.

12/7/237 1

Government Notice No. 610 of 1977

STOCK, BONDS AND TREASURY BILLS ACT, 1976
(6 of 1976)

TREASURY BILLS REGULATIONS, 1976
(S.I1. 143 of 1976)

Applications for Government of Botswana Treasury Bills

The Minister of Finance and Development Planning hereby gives notice that applications will be received
at the Bank of Botswana, Khama Crescent, Gaborone, on Thursday, 27th October, 1977, at 12 noon, for
Treasury Bills to be issued under the Stock, Bonds and Treasury Bills Act, 1976, and in accordance with the
Treasury Bills Regulations, 1976, to the amount of P1 000 000.

2. The price per cent at which the Bills will be offered will be published by the Bank of Botswana not later
than 9 a.m. on Thursday, 27th October, 1977.

3. The Bills will be in amounts of P1 000 or a multiple of P1 000. They will be dated 28th October, 1977,
and will be due 91 days after date.

4. The Bills will be issued and paid at the Bank of Botswana.

5. Each application must be for a minimum of P1 000.

6. Applications must be made through a commercial bank in Botswana.

7. Notification will be sent, on the same day as applications are received, to the persons whose applications
are accepted in whole or in part.

8. Payment in full of the amount due in respect of such accepted applications must be made to the Bank of
Botswana by means of cash or by draft or cheque drawn on the Bank of Botswana not later than noon on the
day on which the relative Bills are to be dated.

9. Applications must be made on the official printed forms which may be obtained from the commercial
banks or the Accounts and Banking Office, Bank of Botswana.

10. The Minister of Finance and Development Planning reserves the right to reject any application in
whole or in part.

DATED this 12th day of October, 1977.

B.I. GASENNELWE,
Acting Permanent Secretary,
Ministry of Finance and Development
Planning.
FDPC 3/8/25
L2/7/237 I
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Government Notice No. 611 of 1977
ELECTORAL ACT
(Cap. 02:07;

Establishment and Names of Polling Stations

IT IS HEREBY NOTIFIED for general information that, in accordance with section 5 (2) of the Electoral
Act, I have added to the number of polling stations set forth in the Schedule to Government Notice No. 152
of 1973. T have established in respect of the polling stations specified in the first column of the Schedule
additional polling stations at the places specified in the second column of the said Schedule, such polling
stations to be known by the names respectively specified in the third column of the said Schedule.

Polling District

SCHEDULE
Situation of
Polling Station
MOSHUPA NO. 27

Name of
Polling Station

Moshupa West Mosielele School Makgalo
Ralekgetho Borehole Ralekgetho
Tshwaane Cattle Crush Tshwaane

Moshupa North
Moshupa South
Ranaka

Kgabosetso School
Kgabophuti School
Ranaka School

Moshupa North
Moshupa South
Ranaka

Ntlhantlhe Ntlhantlhe School Ntlhantlhe
Lekgolobotlo School Lekgolobotlo
Kgomokasitwa School Kgomokasitwa
Manyana Manyana School Manyana
KANYE SOUTH NO. 28
Dilolwe District Commissioners Office,
Kanye Dilolwe
Mafhikana Kanye Restaurant, Kanye Matfhikana
Mumatshitswana King George V. Memorial Hall ~ Mmatshitswana
Lotlhakane School Lotlhakane
Nyorosi Maisantwa School Nyorosi
Gathwane Gathwane School Gathwane
Digawana School Digawana
Molapowabojang School Molapowabojang
Mogojwegojwe School Mogojwegojwe
Gatampa Kgotla Gatampa
Pelotshetlhe School Pelotshetlhe
KANYE NORTH NO. 29
Ntlhaatlase Mapalamo School, Kanye Ntlhaatlase
Kgosing Council Offices, Kanye Kgosing
Bagami Tomela Council Hall Tomela
Maokane Maokane School Maokane
Samane School Samane
Selokolela School Selokolela
Gasita School Gasita
Mokhumma Borehole Mokhumma
Jwana Borchole Jwana
Tsonyane Borehole Tsonyane
Diphatana Borehole Diphatana
Loherwane Borehole Loherwane
Moshaneng Moshaneng School Moshaneng
NGWAKETSE AND KGALAGADI NO. 30
Kalagadi Khakea School Khakea
Mabutsane School Mabutsane
Keng School Keng
Sckoma Kgotla Sckoma
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Konkwa Borehole Konkwa
Morwamosu Borehole Morwamosu
Kokong School Kokong
Mabule Mabule School Mabule
Sekhutlane Borehole Sekhutlane
Leporung School Leporung
Mmakgori School Mmakgori
Tshidilamolomo School Tshidilamolomo
Dikhukhung Kgotla Dikhukhung

Phitshane-Molopo

Phitshane-Molopo School
Sedibeng Borehole

Phitshane-Molopo
Sedibeng

Mokgomane Kgotla Mokgomane
Mmathethe Mmathethe School Mmathethe

Magoriapitse School Magoriapitse

Metlobo School Metlobo

Segwagwa Pan Segwagwa

Tsoaneng Kgotla Tsoaneng

Kanngwe Shop Kanngwe

DATED this 10th day of October, 1977.
P.L. STEENKAMP,
Supervisor of Elections.

L2/7/63 1

Government Notice No. 612 of 1977

Corrigendum
In the proviso to bye-law 2 of S.1. 106 of 1977, between the words “‘such land” and *‘were unimproved”,
which appear therein, insert the words “shall be calculated as if such land”.

L2/8/9/ IV

Government Notice No. 592 of 1977

INDUSTRIAL DEVELOPMENT ACT
(Cap. 43:01)

Notice of Application for Licence to Manufacture

IN ACCORDANCE with the provisions of section 6 of the Industrial Development Act, notice is hereby
given that the following application for a licence to manufacture has been made.

Name of applicant and address :

Wire Products (Pty.) Ltd., P.O. Box 214, Gaborone.
List of products it is proposed to manufacture :

Fencing Materials, i.e. Barbed Wire, Gates, Poles, Stays, etc.
Proposed location of manufacturing activities :

Gaborone.

2. Any person who wishes to make representations in terms of section 8 (1) of the Act may do so in writing
to the Minister of Commerce and Industry, Private Bag 004, Gaborone, and should also send a copy of such
representations to the applicant, within fourteen days of the second and last publication of this notice.

DATED this 28th day of September, 1977.

I, TsHEkoO,
for Permanent Secretary,

Minist 3
L2714 11 inistry of Commerce and Industry

Second Publication
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PUBLIC NOTICES

Licences

Notice is hereby given that the persons specified hereunder intend to apply for certificates under the terms
of section 10 of the Trading Act (No. 6 of 1966).

Name and Address Type of Licence Location Council Date of
hearing
K.C. Lekoko, RESTAURANT TLokwWENG SoutH East DisTrICT 29.11.77
P.O. Box 5015, CounciL
GABORONE.
PROSYS (Pry.) Ltp., SPECIALITY 21 EmBassy CHAMBERs, GABORONE Town 9.11.77
P.O. Box 1383, THE MaLL CounciL
‘ GABORONE.
PROSYS (Pry.) Ltp., WHOLESALE 21 EmBassy CHAMBERS, GABORONE Town 9.11.77
P.O. Box 1383, THE MaLL CounciL
GABORONE.
Y. Asvar, GENERAL TRADING TsHaBONG Kcaracapi DistricT 8.11.77
P.O. Box 50, (SELF SERVICE SUPER- CounciL
. TSHABONG. MARKET AND RECORD
Bar)
A.M. BogaTsu, SMaLL GENERAL KAGISO SECONDARY SoutH East DistrRICT 29.11.77
- Bamangwato TrabpING ScHooL CounciL

Concession Ltd.,
SELEBI-PHIKWE.

T. MAKABE, SMALL GENERAL RamoTswa SoutH East DisTrICT 29.11.77
P.O. Box 6, TraDpING CounciL

RAMOTSWA.

C. NTSHWENE, SMALL GENERAL RaMoTswa SoutH East DisTrICT 29.11.77
P.O. Box 96, TraDING CounciL

RAMOTSWA.

S.B. Koma, SMALL BAKERY MAHALAPYE CenTrRAL DisTrICT 25.11.77
P.O. Box 42, CounciL

MAHALAPYE.

G.S. Koma, SmaLL GENERAL MAKWATE CENTRAL DisTRICT 25.11.77
P.O. Box 42, TraDING CounciL

MAHALAPYE.

CHOBE BRIGADES GAaRAGE aND FiLLing  Kazuncura CHoOBE DisTrICT 25.11.77
DEeVELOPMENT TRUST, STATION COMMISSIONER

KASANE.

Any person objecting to the grant of such certificate(s) should, within 7 days of the second publication of
this/these notice(s), give notice in writing to the said council of his intention to oppose such application and
state the grounds upon which his objection is based.

Second Publication
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Hawker’s Licences

Notice is hereby given that the undersigned intend to apply for a certificate in terms of Bye-Law 8 ot the
Hawking (Model) Bye-Laws, 1967, to obtain a Hawkers Licence.

Name and Address Place(s) where Licence(s) District Council Date. of
Applied for hearing

L.K. Mobisk, JwaNeNG, DIPHATANA, MASOKE,  SOUTHERN DisTrICT 25.11.77
P.O. Box 168, TLANEGE, PITSENG, MoLAPO-wA-  CouNcIL
KANYE. BASADI, NALEDI AND

GAMOGAPINYANE
J. Kortsiwe, RasesA, MALOTWANA, PILANE KcaTLENG DisTrIiCT 25.11.77
P.O. Box 208, AND MocHUDI CounciL
MOCHUDI.
D. Npusano, DUKWE, MAKGADIKGADI SALT CENTRAL DisTrICT 25.11.77
GWETA VILLAGE, MINE, SEMOWANE, KHUMAGA, CounciL
via Francistown. MAKALAMABEDI GATE, NATA
K.G. Kgosi, MATAKANA, MALEGONG, CENTRAL DisTrICT 25.11.77
P.O. Box 538, Puejenaa, CHAMSHONGO, CounciL
FRANCISTOWN. CHAMINI, MEYA, NAKALAKGO-

NGWANA, PaLamMa-O-KUWE AND

LekoBA
[.M. MoTsaMmar, MauNaTLaLA, KGAGODI AND CENTRAL DisTrICT 25.11.77
P.O. Box 215, SELEBI-PHIKWE CounciL
SELEBI-PHIKWE.
B. KGaTHI, Maswg, THUNE, TseBaNaNA AND  CENTRAL DisTRICT 25.11.77
P.O. Box 2, MasiapiEME LANDS, MATHATHALE, CouUNcIL
BOBONONG, MonNOWE aND PHIKWE CATTLE
via Selebi-Phikwe. PosTs
K.T. MAzHADZA & PARTNERS, Komaca, MOREOMAOTO, CENTRAL DIsTRICT 25.11.77

P.O. Box 20,
RAKOPS,
via Francistown.

Ncamisang, Dikwarong, Tsor,

ZAUGA, SOKWANE AND XEITSHANG

CouncIL

Any person objecting to the grant of such certificate(s) should, within 7 days of the second publication of
this/these notice(s), give notice in writing to the said council of his intention to oppose such application and
state the grounds upon which his objection is based.

Second Publication

Hawkers/Street Vendors Licences
Notice is hereby given that the undersigned intend to apply for Licences in terms of Bye-Laws 5 and 8 of
the Gaborone Hawking and Street Vending Bye-Laws, 1977, to obtain a Hawker’s Licence/Street Vendor’s
Licence in respect of areas within the Gaborone Township —

Name and Address Place(s) where Licence(s) Council Date of
Applied for hearing

K. Mosarwa, NALEDI GaABORONE TownN 9.11.77

P.O. Box 75, CounciL

GABORONE.

P. Koitsiwe, GABORONE VILLAGE GAaBORONE Town 9.11.77

P.O. Box 255, CounciL

GABORONE.

T. MPOLOKENG, OLp AND NEw NaLeDl, ViLLAGE GaBoronE Town 9.11.77

OLD NALEDI. AND GaBORONE TownsHIP CounciL

N. KgarTiso, BonTLENG, EXTENSIONS 15, 10, GAaBORONE Town 9.11.77

P.O. Box 171, 12 AND BROADHURST CounciL

GABORONE.

B.S. SEBONEGO, NaLEDI (BOoTSHABELO) GaBoroNE Town 9.11.77

P.O. Box 162, CouxciL

GABORONE.
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S. GABANAKGANG, ExT. 6 GABORONE Town 9.11.77
Ithuteng Primary School, CouncIL
GABORONE.
O. PHEAGA, OLb NALEDI GaBoroNE Town 9.11.77
P.O. Box 916, CounciL
GABORONE.
J.L. MaLEFo, OLp NaLEDI GaBoronE Town 9.11.77
P.O. Box 189, CounciIL
GABORONE.
G. PHokEDI, GABORONE AND WHITE CITY GaBORONE Town 9.11.77
P.O. Box 46, CounciL
MOCHUDI.
F. DitLHONG, WHITE CiTy, EXT. 6 AND ExT. 2 GaBORONE Town 9.11.77
P.O. Box 883, CounciL

. GABORONE.
B.A. MOLOKWANE, BoNTLENG GaBorRONE Town 9.11.77
P.O. Box 198, CounciL
GABORONE.
F. Mroru, New NALEDI GaBoronNE Town 9.11.77
P.O. Box 966, CounciL
GABORONE.

Any person objecting to the grant of such certificate(s) should, within 7 days of the second publication of
this/these notice(s) give notice in writing to the said Council of his intention to oppose such application and
state the grounds upon which his objection is based.

Second Publication
Transfers
‘ Notice is hereby given that the undersigned intend to apply for a certificate in terms of Section 10 of the
Trading Act, 1966 (No. 6 of 1966 to obtain a transfer of licence.

A transfer of a RESTAURANT LICENCE INTO A SMaLL GENERAL TraDING LICENCE in respect of the premises
situated at TLOKWENG and that the Soutn East DisTrict CounciL has determined that the application shall
be heard by the Licensing Authority on the 29th November, 1977.

M.B. Lekoko, P.O. Box 5035, GABORONE.
A transfer of a SMaLL GENERAL TRADING LICENCE in respect of the premises situated at MATLAPANENG and

that the Norta WEsT DistricT Counci has determined that the application shall be heared by the Licensing
Authority on the 4th November, 1977.

R.M. Swanka, P.O. Box 7, MAUN.

A transfer of a FResnu Propuce LICENCE INTO A BUTCHERY LICENCE in respect of the premises situated at
Losatse and that the LoBaTsE Town CounciL has determined that the application shall be heard by the
Licensing Authority on the 3rd November, 1977.

I. Garikayi, P.O. Box 135, LOBATSE.

Any person objecting to the grant of such certificate(s) should, within 7 days of the second publication of
this/these notice(s), give notice in writing to the said council of his intention to oppose such application and
state the grounds upon which his objection is based.

Second Publication
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Ghanzi District Council - Tender No. 11 of 1977

Tenders are invited by Ghanzi District Council for the construction of Projects listed below. Tenders should
include labour, provision for materials and transport.

KUKE SCHOOL

One dining hall/kitchen block (Plan KF.E.2125.2)
Two ablution blocks (Plan KF.E.2125.3)

One healthpost H.P.2 (Plan XX/L6/1612/3)

2 Stage 11 houses (Plan XX.N29.1959)

2 Toilets (Plan KF.E.2125.3)

Double classrooms block (Plan XX.E.1192)
Storerooms Type D (Plan XX.E.1161)
Boys hostels: 9 Asbestos rondavels Type A
Girls hostels: 11 Asbestos rondavels Type A

Drainage Plan - XX.P2.1720
Site Plan - KF.E.2125.1
Fencing

Tenders should be submitted for each Project separately. In addition to separate tenders, tenders may be
submitted for several or all projects together. However, no such tenders will be considered unless they are
accompanied by separate tenders, establishing the prize for each project. Plans may be inspected at the
Council Works Office by appointment.

Tenders must specify starting date and length of time for completion.

Tenders must be addressed to Council Secretary’s Office, P.O. Box 4, Ghanazi in plain sealed envelopes
clearly marked ‘“Tender No. 11 of 1977, and must be received by the Council Secretary’s Office before the
9th November, 1977.

Council does not bind itself to accept the lowest or any of the tenders and reserves the right to accept or
reject the whole or part of any tender.

T. KELEBEMANG,
JSor Council Secretary.

Second Publication

North West District Council - Tender No. 5 of 1977 “
SALE OF 6 VEHICLES
Tenders are invited for the purchase of the following vehicles:
BJ 221 $ ton Toyota Land Cruiser bought in 1974. Reserve price is P1 100.
BJ 255 $-ton Toyota Land Cruiser bought in 1973. Reserve price is P1 200.
BJ 223 }-ton Toyota Land Cruiser bought in 1974. Reserve price is P 1 900.
BJ 552 14-ton Chevrolet bought in 1972. Reserve price is P1 000.
BJ 543 Leyland 16 tonner truck bought in 1974. Reserve price is P14 000.
BJ 503 14-ton Bedford bought in 1972. Reserve price is P700.
B. (a) The vehicles are in good running condition and may be inspected during normal working hours
at the Council Workshop, Maun.

(b) Tenders should be submitted in plain sealed envelopes clearly marked *““Tender No. 5 for 1. BJ 221
#-ton Toyota Land Cruiser or tender for 4. BJ 552 14-ton Chevrolet”, as appropriate and must
reach the Council on or before 11th November, 1977 not later than 9.00 a.m.

Each vehicle will be sold to the highest tenderer provided the highest tender equals or exceeds the

reserve price quoted above against each vehicle.

(d) The sales will be in cash and must be effected within seven days of notification to the successful
tenderers.

Z DO R

()

G.G.S. PULE,
JSor Council Secretary.

Second Publication




865

North West District Council - Tender No. 6 of 1977
SUPPLY OF FOUR (4) }-TON TOYOTA LAND CRUISERS

Tenders are invited for the supply of four (4) §-ton petrol Toyota Land Cruisers with steel canopies, large
side windows, long range fuel and water tanks, bush guards, and 8 ply tyres. The following extras should be
quoted separately: full length roof racks, extra spare wheels, spare wheels mounting brackets on roof racks.

Tenders must be sent in sealed envelopes clearly marked “Tender No. 6 of 1977 for the supply of 4 Toyota

Land Cruisers” to the Council Secretary and must be received in this office not later than 9.00 a.m. on 11th
November, 1977.

Council will not necessarily accept the lowest or any bid nor does it bind itself to give any explanation for
its decision.
G.G.S. PuLE,
Sor Council Secretary.

P.O. Box 80,
MAUN.

Second Publication

North West District Council - Tender No. 7 of 1977

SUPPLY OF SCHOLARS’ BOOKS AND STATIONERY, TEACHERS’ BOOKS AND
STATIONERY

Tenders are invited for the supply of scholars’ books and stationery, teachers’ books and stationery for 1978.

Detailed list of requirements may be obtained from the undersigned. Tenders must be in plain sealed
envelopes marked “Tender No.'7 of 1977 for Scholars’ Books and Stationery, Teachers’ Books and Station-
ery”.

All tenders must be in the hands of the Administrative Secretary (Education), North West District
Council, P.O. Box 80, Maun, not later than 31st October, 1977.

Council does not bind itself to accept the lowest or any tender nor will it assign any reason for acceptance or
refusal of any tender.

M.R. MOSEKIEMANG,
Administrative Secretary ( Education).

Second Publication

Lobatse Valuation Court
TOWN COUNCIL REGULATIONS, 1966

It is hereby notified for general information that the Lobatse Valuation Court will sit in the Council
Chamber on Thursday 27th October, 1977 at 1415 hours.

All those property owners and/or their duly authorised representatives who have indicated in writing their
intention to object to the Valuation of their properties, as scheduled in the Interim Valuation Roll as at
30th June, 1977, should appear before the Valuation Court on the date and at the time specified above.

M.R. TSHIPINARE,

or Clerk of the Court.
Second Publication % 4

Lobatse Town Council - Tender No. 11/77

Lobatse Town Council invites tenders for the supply and delivery of furniture for Woodhall School as
follows:
90 stacking chairs — 33,02 cm (13”) high
32 trapezoid tables — 60,96 cm (24”) high
45 stacking chairs — 38,01 cm (15”) high
16 trapezoid tables — 66,04 cm (26”) high
90 school desks with lift-up top — 71,12 cm (28”) high
90 school chairs with painted mesonite seats and backs — 45,72 cm (18”) high.
60 office tables with 2 drawers - 1,67 m x 1 m (5" x 3)

7 Sta type office chairs.

The closing date is 14th November, 1977 at 1.00 p.m. Tenders have to be sent in a sealed envelope clearly
marked “Tender No. 11/77” to be addressed to the Town Clerk, P.O. Box 27, Lobatse.

The Council does not bind itself to accept the lowest or any tender.

C.J. BUTALE,

JSor Town Clerk.
Second Publication
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Licences

Notice is hereby given that the persons specified hereunder intend to apply for certificates under the terms
of section 10 of the Trading Act (No. 6 of 1966).

Name and Address Type of Licence Location Council Date of
hearing

K.R. PATEL, GEeNERAL TRADING ProT No. 4803, GaBoroNE TowN 14.12.77

Sfor Windorf (Pty.) Ltd., CouncIL

P.O. Box 214, Prot INDUSTRIAL SITES

GABORONE.

D.M. JoHNsON, GENERAL TrRADING MMATHETHE SouTHERN DisTrICT 25.11.77

c/o Kirby, Helfer and CounciL

Khama

P.O. Box 882,

GABORONE.

;gog(zf’gg ButcuEry D’kar GHanzi DisTrIiCT 29.11.77
J. X s C A

GHANZI. ouNeit

S.T. LEKHUTILE, Fresu ProbucE Prot No. 4262 SeLeBi-Puikwe Town  30.11.77

P.O. Box 3, (ButcHERY, FrurTs CouncIL

SELEBI-PHIKWE. AND VEGETABLES)

M. Noxo, RESTAURANT BoTsHABELO SELEBI-PHIKWE TowN 30.11.77

P.O. Box 435, CounciIL

SELEBI-PHIKWE

M. Sesinvi, Fruit SHoP MMADINARE CENTRAL DisTRICT 25.11.77

P.O. Box 26, CounciIL

MMADINARE.

M. Torn, FiLLinG StaTION PALAPYE-SEROWE- CeNTRAL DisTrICT 25.11.77

P.O. Box 129, AND GARAGE MaHaLAPYE RoAD CounciL

SEROWE. T-juncTioN

Any person objecting to the grant of such certificate(s) should, within 14 days of the first publication of
this/these notice(s), give notice in writing to the said council of his"intention to oppose such appfication and
state the grounds upon which his objection is based.

First Publication

Hawkers/Street Vendors Licences
Notice is hereby given that the undersigned intend to apply for Licences in terms of Bye-Laws 5 and 8 of
the Gaborone Hawking and Street Vending Bye-Laws, 1977, to obtain a Hawker’s Licence/Street Vendor’s
Licence in respect of areas within the Gaborone Township —

Name and Address Place(s) where Licence(s) Council Dateof
Applied for hearing

L. PamPiri, BROADHURST, NEwW CaANADA Gasorone Town 14.12.77

clo Kirby, Helfer and Khama, OLp aND NEW NALEDI CounciL

P.O. Box 882, AND TLOKWENG

GABORONE.

S. OTsE, ExXTENsION 5 GaBorONE Town 9.11.77

House No. 15, CounciL

OLD NALEDI.

T.P. MATHiso, INDUSTRIAL SITES GaBoroNE Town 9.11.77

P.O. Box 329, CounciL

GABORONE.

B.B. MmoLal, OLDp NALEDI GABORONE TownN 9.11.77

P.O. Box 212, CounciL

GABORONE.
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E. Ncuse, " EXTENsION 8 GaBoroNE Town .9.11.77
P.O. Box 886, CounciL

GABORONE.

B. PHERESI, BoNTLENG GAaBORONE Town 9.11.77
P.O. Box 316, CounciL

GABORONE.

E.S. SitHoLE, GABORONE GaBorONE Town 9.11.77
P.O. Box 866, CounciL

GABORONE.

Any person objecting to the grant of such certificate(s) should, within 14 days ot the first publication of
this/these notice(s), give notice in writing to the said council of his’intention to oppose such application and
state the grounds upon which his objection is based.

First Publication

Hawker’s Licence
Notice is hereby given that the undersigned intend to apply for a certificate in terms of Bye-Law 8 of the
Hawking (Model) Bye-Laws, 1967, to obtain a Hawkers Licence.

Name and Address Place(s) where Licence(s) Dastrict Council Date of
Applied for hearing
R.M. POROGWANE, MMAaMAIRI, POTSANE, SoutH East DisTrICT 29.11.77
P.O. Box 135, MATLAPEKWE, M AOKAMATSHWANE CoUNcIL
LOBATSE. AND M AGOTANE LANDS
O. MOLEFHE, TEWANE, RADISELE, CeENTRAL DisTrICT 25.11.77
P.O. Box 241, KEBUAKABOMO, M ABATWE, CounciL
iAHALAPYE. M ATSOSADIKGANG, AND MATHAPE

LanDps, MMAKGOGO AND TELEKELA

CATTLE Posts
G.B. Nawa, NTLHANTLHE, MAGOTLWANE, SouTHERN DisTRICT 25.11.77
P.O. Box 331, KcoMokasiTwa, RANAKA, CounciL
GABORONE. LEKGOLOBOTLO, MANYANA AND

MOGONYE
M.T. MONGALA, KANYE, DINATSHANA, SOUTHERN DisTrICT 25.11.77
P.O. Box 46, MOLAPOWABOJANG, CounciL
KANYE. GAMOGAPINYANA, MAGOTLHWANE,

MMABADISA, MMATHETHE,

LOTLHAKANE, KGOMOKASITWA,

DiLojaNA, DIBAJWAKWENA AND

TaupPoNE
M. KESUPILE, Koxkawa, THaRI, KEYa, SouTHERN DisTrICT 25.11.77
P.O. Box 134, Majaxg, KEng, JwaNENG CounciL
KANYE. PHUDUHUDU, KHESEKWE,

DIKGANKANE, MOLEFELE,

KokoNG AND MORWAMOSO
K.K. KETUMILE, KANYE SouTH, MMAMODUNGWA,  SOUTHERN DisTrICT 25.11.77

P.O. Box 95,
KANYE.

SOBATLWE, MMODUHUTSWI, CounciL
NGWANAMARUNGWANE,

DiLonyaRa, MMABADISA,

AND TSOKWANE

Any person objecting to the grant of such certificate(s) should, within 14 days ot the first publication of
this/these notice(s), give notice in writing to the said council of his’intention to oppose such application and
state the grounds upon which his objection is based.

First Publication




868

Transferg

Notice is hereby given that the undersigned intendsto apply for a certificate in terms of Section 10 of the
Trading Act, 1966 (No. 6 of 1966) to obtain a transfer of licence.
A transfer of a CHEMIsT LICENCE in respect of premises situated at Suop No. 5, Arrica Housk, FrancisTOoWN
and that the FrancistowN Town Counciw has determined that the application shall be heard by the Licens-
ing Authority on the 10th November, 1977.

FrancisTowN Puarmacy (Pry.) L1p., /o J.Z. Mosojane and Partners, Applicant’s Attorneys, P.O. Box 484,
FRANCISTOWN.
Any person objecting to the grant of such certificate(s) should, within 14 days of the first publication of
this/these notice(s), give nogice in writing to the appropriate council of his intention to oppose such
application and state the grounds upon which his objection is based.

First Publication

Notice of Intention to Transfer a Trading Licence

Notice is hereby given in terms of section 28 (1) of the Trading Act, (1966), that Wateka Mphatiwa has
disposed of his entire interest on the business of Restaurant at site No. 90 Mzizi Street, Tati West, Francistown
to Letsididi who will continue to trade at the same addres and under the same style.

W. MpHATIWA, P.O. Box 56, FRANCISTOWN.

First Publication

Notice of Intention to Transfer a Trading Licence

Notice is hereby given in terms of section 25 (1) of the Trading Act, 1966, that Orcades Pharmaceuticals
(Proprietary) Limited (in liquidation) have disposed of their entire interest in the chemist shop at Africa
House, Francistown to Francistown Pharmacy (Proprietary) Limited who will continue to trade at the same
premises and under the name and style of Francistown Pharmacy.

J.Z. MosojANE & PARTNERS,
Attorneys for the Parties.

5 Africa House,
P.O. Box 484,
FRANCISTOWN.

First Publication

Kweneng District Council - Tender No. 21/77
SUPPLY OF BULDING MATERIALS

The Kweneng District Gouncil invites tenders for the supply of building materials for:

(a) 6 Revenue Offices (10 m?2)

(8) 5 Teachers’ Houses

(¢) 13 Latrines.

Complete lists of materials can be obtained from Works Department, Molepolole.

Tenderers must make clear the conditions for the supply of the materials.

Council is interested in prices, both ex-factory and delivered in Molepolole.

Tenders must be sent in sealed envelopes clearly marked ‘“Tender No. 21/77” to Council Secretary,

Private Bag 005, Molepolole and must be received in this office not later than 4.30 p.m. on 7th November.

1977.

Council will not necessarily accept the lowest or any bid.
KURT ANDREASEN,
for Council Secretary.

Kweneng District Council,
Private Bag 005,
Molepolole.
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Central District Council - Tender No. 15 of 1977
SUPPLY OF PUPILS AND TEACHERS’ BOOKS, STATIONERY AND EQUIPMENT

Tenders are hereby invited for the supply of pupils’ and teachers’ books, stationery and equipment for
1978/79.

Detailed lists of approximate requirements may be obtained from the undersigned. Suppliers should state
the prices for unit and bulk supplies free on rail to Palapye. Samples of books stationery and equipment must
accompany the tenders.

All tenders must be addressed to the Council Secretary, Central District Council, Private Bag 1, Serowe, to
reach his office on or before 4 p.m. on Friday 11th November, 1977 in plain sealed envelopes clearly marked
“Tender for Pupils’ and Teachers’ Books, Stationery and Equipment’.

Council does not bind itself to accept the lowest or any tender, nor will it assign any reasons for the rejection
of any tender.
G.J. KEsIANYE,

. L or Council Secretary.
First Publication f uncib.oecreiar)

Central District Council - Tender No. CDC/17/77
SUPPLY OF TOOLS AND SHELF UNITS

Tenders are invited by the Central District Council for the supply of tools and shelf units as listed hereunder:

1. 30 units steel shelves; size per-unit 7 high x 3’ long x 2" wide x 5 compartments.

NB. Shelve units should include quotations for each shelf compartment divided into four small partitions of

equal sizes with closed backs and sides to hold loose small items.

2. 4 Trolleys, four wheeled platform type—solid tyres,

4 Sack trucks, two wheeled-solid tyres,

4 Crow bars (nail puller),

4 Claw hammers,

4 Tin snips,

4 pairs pliers,

2 Binding Machires (specify type of binding tapes).

Tenders for above items must be received by the Council Secretary, Central District Council, Private Bag 1,
Serowe, Botswana, not later than 9 a.m. on 31st October, 1977. All tenders must be enclosed in plain sealed
envclopes clearly marked “Tender for Supply of Tools and Shelf units”.

All quotations should be f.o.r. Palapye Station. Tenders received after closing time and date and tele-
phonic or telegraphic tenders will not be considered.

The Central District Council reserves the right not to accept the lowest or any tender, or to accept any tender
in whole or as regards some of the items specified, each being for this purpose considered as tendered for separ-
ately.

The successful tenderers shall be notified by means of telegram that their tenders have been accepted. The
supplier shall not excute any consignment unless an official Local Purchase Order is received. On receipt of
the official document, the successful supplier shall then supply accordingly.

A.M. NTSEANE,
Sor Council Secretary.

Married Persons Property Act, No. 69/70

Notice is hereby given that in terms of section 4 (2) of the Married Person’s Property Act No. 69/70 as

amended by section 2 of the Law Reform (Married Women’s Property) Act No. 17/75.
ANDREW WILLIAM LUDICK
and
THERESA LUDICK

have this day executed a Notarial Deed of Exclusion of Community of Property from a Marriage entered into
Prior to Ist January, 1971. This Deed is being submitted to the Registrar of Deeds for Botswana for regis-
tration.

Any person or persons having objections to the registration of the same, shall lodge his /their objection with
the Registrar of Deeds within 28 days of the publication hereof.

J.Z. MosoJANE & PARTNERs,
Applicant’s Attorneys.

P.O. Box 484,
FRANCISTOWN.
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Change of Name

Notice is hereby given that an application will be made to the Registrar of Companics, Gaborone, not less
than fourteen days (14) days after the date of publication of this notice, for his approval of change of the name
of E & M Engineering Services (Pty.) Ltd.. 10 A & M Services (Pty.) Ltd.

N.S. Rao,
P.O. Box 247,
FRANCISTOWN.

Church sites in Lobatse
Lobatse Town Council informs that six (6) church sites will soon be available in the Woodhall Area in
Lobatse. Questionaires and further information can be obtained from the Town Clerk, P.O. Box 27, Lobatse.
The questionnaires, duly completed, to be received by the office of the Town Clerk on or before 2nd
January, 1977.
B. CzecH,
JSor Town Clerk.

First Publication

Republic of Botswana - Tender No. TB 9/5/22/ 77-78
RESEALING TLOKWENG GATE ROAD

Tenders are invited from registered Civil Enginecring Contractors for the resealing of the 7.75 km of
experimental sections on the Tlokweng Gate Road.

Documents will be available from the Chicf Roads Engincer, Private Bag 0026, Gaborone on or after 14th
October, 1977.

Tenders must reach the Secretary, Central Tender Board, Private Bag 0058, Gaborone, by registered post or
by hand in plain sealed envelopes marked “TB 9/5/22/77-78 — Resealing Tlokweng Gate Road” not later
than 9 a.m. on the 2nd of November, 1977. Telegraphic, telephonic or telex tenders will not be considered.

The lowest or any tender will not necessarily be accepted.

Any further information regarding this tender may be obtained from the office of the Chief Roads Engincer,
telephone Gaborone 5515/6/7.

K.K. SEMELAMELA,
Secretary, Central Tender Board.

Republic of Botswana - Tender No. TB 9/3/35/77-78

SUPPLY, DELIVERY, INSTALLATION AND COMMISSIONING OF LAUNDRY
EQUIPMENT FOR FRANCISTOWN HOSPITAL AND E.N.S. SCHOOLS

Tenders are invited for the Supply, Delivery, Installation and Commissioning of Laundry Equipment for
Francistown Hospital and Nurses Schools at Lobatse, Molepolole and Serowe.
Documents and drawings are available on application to the office of the Chief Architect, Room 204,
Ministry of Works and Communications Building, Gaborone or by post to Private Bag 0025, Gaborone.
Tenders to be submitted to the Secretary, Central Tender Board, Room 306, Ministry of Finance Building,
Gaborone or by post to Private Bag 0058, Gaborone, Botswana, to arrive not later than 9.00 a.m. on Wednes-
day 9th November, 1977 when they will be opened in the presence of those tenderers wishing to attend.
Telegraphic, Telephonic or telex tenders will not be considered. The lowest or any tender will not necessarily
be accepted.
K.K. SEMELAMELA,
Secretary, Central Tender Board.
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It is hereby notified for general information that the following arms and ammunition have been awarded to the highest bidders as shown below.
Claim to the Central Arms Registry, P.O. Box 516, Gaborone.

Item No.
I
2
3
4.
3.
6.
7.
8.
9,
10.
1.
12.
13.
14.
15.
16.
17.
18.
19.
),

Calibre
.375 Sako Rifle
.30 Remington Rifle:

30/06 Netro Proof Rifle

.303 Greener Rifle
.303 Enfield Rifle
303 MUK, 4 Rifle
303 BSA Co. Rifle
303 BSA Co. Rifle
.303 BSA Co. Rifle
.303 BSA Co. Rifle
303 Rifle

.303 Netro Rifle
.303 Enfield Rifle
303 BSA Co. Rifle
2303 Enfield Rifle
.303 Rifle

2303 BSA Co. Rifle
303 BSA Co. Rifle
303 Rifle

.303 Rifle

.303 Rifle

.303 Rifle BSA Co.
.303 Enfield Rifle
.303 Enfield Rifle
M/Henry Rifle
M/Henry Rifle
M/Henry Rifle
M/Henry Rifle
M/Henry Rifle
M/Henry Rifle
M/Henry Rifle
M/Henry Rifle
M/Henry Rifle

Sale of Firearms and Ammunition - TB 2/8/3/77-78

Number
10683+
21357
!
S.7306-R (1832
3528
3600517,
1052-A. 17176
31841
1162
33914-63293
3871-130068
2050, BOL'T. 79780
31041
850206
GO0
776
399
(.95869
BPX 6003
3116
H897
19326
359
RESNC]
BPD 3935

BPB 1688

92

27784

9518-6

G.576Y9
4816-1715-19236
BPK.13

T —

FINAL RESULTS

FIREARMS

Tender No.
161 C
28 C
47 A
209 A
19 A
206 A
29 A
83 B
+3 B
200 B
259 C
+ A
274 C
267 C
94 A
146 C
217 C
98 C
65> B
180 B
151 B
1 C
2B
206 A
142 G
107 B
13 A
131 B
36 A
106 B
121 B
160 B
206 B

Bid

P750,00
P310,00
P426,99
P170,00
P100,99
P355,00
P330,00

‘)

80,00

P100,99
P250,00
P300,05
P200,00
P250,00
300,90
P300,00
155,00
300,00
P-440,00
200,00
225,00
P300,00
P170,00
P140,05
P275,00
P100,00

P
r
P
l)
])
P
l)
I

°

10,00
15,00
23,00
60,00
10,00
23,00
90,00
20,00

Successful Tenderer
R.S. Riggs, Box 183, Francistown
G.G. Van Staden, Box 987, Gaborone
G. Gakelona, Box 570, Gaborone
G. Makgotho, Box 71, Maun
M. Makgetla, Khakhia Village, P/Bag Kanye
P.L. Kirby, Box 180, Selebi-Phikwe
James R. Molatole, Box 80, Maun
B.J. Matlapeng, Box 358, Mochudi
G. Okaile, Box 1082, Gaborone
M. Kalantle, Tshane Village, Box 29, Hukuntsi
B.S. Mackepo, P/Bag 002, Gaborone.
Elias K. Nkwane, Box 516, Gaborone
M.M. Talape, ¢/o Gaobewe, Box 536, Gaborone
Jaruta Kerena, Box 44, Maun
J.R. Mc¢ Donald, P/Bag 003, Gaborone
M.G. Silas, P/Bag 003, Gaborone
F. German, Box 224, Maun
W. Mokgabo, Box 64, Maun
Moopi Mabe, Box 64, Maun
L.0O. Saidoo, Box 337, Lobatse
J. Kaartzee, Box 35, Tshabong
K. Karonkwana, P.O. Schitwa, via Maun
S.K. Sckgopa, Box 1082, Gabarone
P.L. Kirby, Box 180, Selebi-Phikwe.
Paster 1.S. Kwenane, Box 114, Maun
D.R. Harris, Box 1082, Gaborone
H.J. Picters, ¢/o Station Master, Ramotswa
J.W. Duncan, Box 517, Gaborone
N.K. Madikwe, Box 987, Gaborone
C. Shields, Box 402, Gaborone
J-W. Duncan, Box 517, Gaborone
M. Mafoko, Box 70, Maun
M. Molatole, Box 517, Gaborone

L8



Item No.
34.
35.
36.

Calibre
6.5 mm Rifle
7 mm Rifle
7 mm Rifle
7 mm Rifle
7 mm Rifle
7 mm Rifle
7 x 57 mm Rifle
7 mm BR Rifle
7 mm Rifle
7 mm Rifle
7 mm Rifle
7.9 mm Rifle
B8 x 57 mm Rifle
9.3 » 62 mm Rifle
.303 BSA Co. Rifle
.303 Enfield Rifle
303 Rifle
410 Mossberg
410 Guernica Spain
S/B .410 Bore Fucile Rinfonzate
D/B 46 Bore Borches Celta
S/B 12 Bore Winchester
S/B 12 Bore Winchester
S/B 12 Bore BSA Co.
S/B 12 Bore H. & Richardson
S/B 12 Bore Winchester
S/B 12 Bore BSA Co. Snipe
S/B 12 Bore lver Johuson

Number
UDP.201-2366
9089-BOLT 790-8369
18
3183-BOLT-6660
BPB.4432
147 BOLT
LP.210-4325
3339
9320
10272
6731-98
176888
9981
19326 BOL'T 19320
339 BOLT 559
5410
110729
375-B1130
75499
24889
110015
135796
Y.B. 9634
V.32261
143532
Y.D. 11517
BPB 1580

Tender No.
183 A
183 A
27C
139 B

98 A
220 B

7B
50 B
217 C
210 C
167 C
77 C
173 C



Bid
P201,99
P177,99
P200,00
P160,00
P120,00
P180,00
P240,05

P195,00
P400,00
P345,00
P210,00
P520,00
P457,99

P450,00
P178,59

P400,00
P157,00
P180,00
P200,00
P180,00
P175,00
225,00
P200,00

Successful Tenderer
T. Baatshwana, P/Bag 0012, Gaborone
T. Baatshwana, PiBag 0012, Gaborone
A.S. Motlhabane, Box 940, Gaborone
L..G. Mangadi, Box 4, Ghanzi
G. Godisamang, Box 143, Serowe
B.K. Bogosi, Box 87, Gaborone
B.S. Gadilefhe, P/Bag 008, Gaborone
Withdrawn by C.A.R., No Rifle
J.F. Thupe, Box 20, Tsabong.
F.P. German, Box 224, Maun
E. Maphanyane, P/Bag 008, Gaborone
B. Makgobi, Box 25, Maun
A.A. Mills, Box 28, Mochudi
G. Gakelona, Box 570, Gaborone
Duplicate of item 22
Duplicate of item 23
Duplicate of item 24
H. Leong, Box 133, Gaborone
G.N. Sechele, Box 80, Maun
Withdrawn by C.A.R., wrong calibre
H. Leong, Box 133, Gaborone
I. Forembi, Box 64, Maun
L..0. Saidoo, Box 337, Lobatse
M.K. Sola, Malambakwena School, P.O. Tshesebe
K.S. Bingana, P/Bag 003, Gaborone.
0.S. Rasool, Box 333, Lobatse
J.R. Mc Donald, P/Bag 003, Gaborone
B. Mashabile, ¢/o Bothongo, Box 1433, Gaborone

eL8




Item No. Calibre Quantity
1 .22 Short 250
L. Balance 1086
2 .22 Long 38
3. .22 Fiochi 20
4. .22 Hornet RED
5. 222 75
6. 243 63
7 25 20 mm 3
8. ..250 0 300 14
9, 264 mm 16
10 .303 100
10. 303 791
1. 308 271
12. 300 43
13. 375 94
14. 357 2
15. A00 360 mm 2
16. 425 Macinum 6
17. 438 mm 9
18. 6.5 mm 33
19. 7 mm 9

20, 7.62 mm 33
21. 7.9 mm 7
22, 8. mm 27
23 8 - 37 mm 38
24, 9.3 mm 30
25. 9.5 mm 4
26. MiHenry 18
27. 12 Boreshots 100
27. 12 Boreshots 100
27. 12 Boreshots 106)
27. 12 Boreshots 100
27. Boreshots 100
27, Balance 232
28. 410 Bore 90
29. 20 Bore 4
30. 16 Bore (3}
31, 6.35 mm 243
32, 7.65 mm 95
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AMMUNITION
Tender
151 C P 2,50
No Bid
125 B P 25,00
No Bid
- No Bid
146 C P 21,00
No Bid
161 C P112.80
- No Bid
- No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
158 A P 12,50
122 A P 2,50
77 C P 20,00
34 A P 15,00
No Bid
31 B P 10
34 A P 15,00
138 C P 17,00
36 C P 15,00
134 C P 11,99
151 C P 12,50
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Tenderers
S.A. Hirshfeld, P/Bag 0012, Gaborone
Tenderers have no arms certificates
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D. Sabuta, Box 534, Tati-Town
Tenderer has no arm certificate

M.G. Silas, P/Bag 005, Gaborone.

Tendcrers have no arms certificates
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R.S. Riggs, Box 185, Francistown

T.M. Mogorosi, cfo M. Shashane, Gaborone.
J. Mathumo, Box 301, Gaborone
Tenderers have no arms certificates
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ALAL Mills, Box 28, Mochudi
K. Simasiku, Martinsdrift, Box 3, Sherwood

S. Pelontle, P.O. Box 80, Gaborone.

K. Simasiku, Martinsdrift, Box 3, Sherwood
Rex Tabute, Tshane Village, P/Bag 10, Lobatse.
S.B. Samasasa, Box 3, Letlhakane

M.S. Merafhe, P/Bag 0012, Gaborone

S.A. Hirschfeld, P/Bag 0012, Gaborone
Tenderers have no arms certificates

Tenderers have no arms certificates

K.K. SEMELAMELA,

Secretary. Central Tender Board.
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