GOVERNMENT GAZETTE

OF THE

REPUBLIC OF NAMIBIA

R0,50

WINDHOEK — 2 December 1991

No. 309

CONTENTS

GOVERNMENT NOTICE

No.

131

Proposal that a trunk road be proclaimed (Number 6/2), that portions of
main road 55 be closed, that the classification of portions of main road 55 be
changed, that district roads be closed, that the classification of portions
of district roads be changed, that farm roads be proclaimed, that farm roads
and portions of farm roads be closed and that the classification of portions

of farm roads be changed: District of Gobabis ..............cccccoomrrrvvrirorrs

GENERAL NOTICES

No.

No.

177

178

. 179

. 180

. 181

. 182

. 183

. 184

. 185

. 186

. 187

. 188

. 189

Municipality of Windhoek: Amendment of Water Supply Regulations ......

City of Windhoek: Permanent closing of portions 1 and 2 of public open

space Erf 5655 Windhoek ..o

City of Windhoek: Permanent closing of portion A of public open space

Erf 789 OlYMPIa ...

City of Windhoek: Permanent closing of portion X of Orion Street, Dorado

Park, EXteNSION 1 .o.oocoioeeeeeees e

Municipality of Grootfontein: Permanent closure of public open spaces .....

Municipality of Gobabis: Permanent closing of parts of streets .........

Application for restoration of a lapsed patent ...,

Bank of Namibia: Statement of assets and liabilities as at the close of business

ON 31 OCLODET 1991 oot eeeee e eeen

Kapps Farm Town Planning Scheme ...

Aris Town Planning Scheme ...

Municipality of Outjo: Amendment of Native Location Regulations

Municipality of Grootfontein: Amendment of Abattoir Regulations

Page

10

12

16

16

16



Government Gazette 2 December 1991

No. 309

Government Notice

MINISTRY OF WORKS,
TRANSPORT AND COMMUNICATION

No. 131 1991

PROPOSAL THAT A TRUNK ROAD BE PROCLAIMED
(NUMBER 6/2), THAT PORTIONS OF MAIN ROAD 55
BE CLOSED, THAT THE CLASSIFICATION OF PORTIONS
OF MAIN ROAD 55 BE CHANGED, THAT DISTRICT ROADS
BE CLOSED, THAT THE CLASSIFICATION OF PORTIONS OF
DISTRICT ROADS BE CHANGED, THAT FARM ROADS BE
PROCLAIMED, THAT FARM ROADS AND PORTIONS OF
FARM ROADS BE CLOSED AND THAT THE
CLASSIFICATION OF PORTIONS OF FARM
ROADS BE CHANGED: DISTRICT OF GOBABIS

In terms of section 20(1) of the Roads Ordinance, 1972 (Ordinance 17 of
1972), it is hereby made known that the Permanent Secretary: Works,
Transport and Communication proposes that, in the district of Gobabis -

(a) on land where no road previously existed, a road as described in
Schedule I and shown on sketch-map P1491 by the symbols F-G-G5-H-
J-K-L-M-N be declared a proclaimed trunk road (number 6/2);

(b) the portions of main road 55 described in each one of Schedules II, I11,
IV and V and shown on sketch-map P1491 by the symbols F-F27,
F1-F2-F3, F5-F6-F7-F8 and F10-F11, respectively, be closed;

(c) the classification of the portion of main road 55 -

(i) described in Schedule VI and shown on sketch-map P1491 by the
symbols A-B-C-D-E-F, be changed to trunk road (number 6/2);

(i1) described in each one of Schedules VII, VIII and IX and shown on
sketch-map P1491 by the symbols F8-F9-F10, F13-F26 and F26-
F14-F15-F16-F17-F18-F19-F20-F21-F22-F23-F24-F25, respec-
tively, be changed to district roads 1707, 1681 and 1739, respec-
tively; and

(ii1) described in each one of Schedules X, XI and XII and shown on
sketch-map P1491 by the symbols F27-F1, F3-F4-F5 and F11-F12-
J15-F13, respectively, be changed to farm roads 1656, 1704 and
1689, respectively;



No. 309

Government Gazette 2 December 1991

(d) the portions of district road 1692 described in each one of Schedules X111
and XIV and shown on sketch-map P1491 by the symbols G2-H1 and
H2-H3-H4-HS-H6, respectively, be closed; _

(e) the classification of the portions of district roads 1601 and 1692
described in each one of Schedules XV, XVI, XVII and XVIII and
shown on sketch-map P1491 by the symbols F1-GS5, G5-G1-G2-G3-G4,
H1-H2 and H6-H7, respectively, be changed to farm roads 1656, 1771,
1686 and 1690, respectively;

(f) the road and the portion of the road described in each one of Schedules
XIX and XX and shown on sketch-map P1491 by the symbols A1-A2
and J7-J8, respectively, be declared farm roads (numbers 1687 and 1827,

“respectively); and

(g) the portions of farm roads 1610, 1690, 1822, 1689, 1691, 1683, 1820 and
1608 described in each one of Schedules XXI to XXIX and shown on
sketch-map P1491, be closed.

A copy of this notice and the said sketch-map, being a sketch-map of the area
concerned on which the roads to which the proposal refers and other
proclaimed, minor and private roads in that area are shown, shall for the full
period of thirty days mentioned below, lie open to inspection at the offices of
the Permanent Secretary: Works, Transport and Communication, Wind-
hoek, and the Roads Superintendent, Gobabis, during normal office hours.

Every person having any objection to the above-mentioned proposal is
hereby commanded to lodge his or her objection in writing, with the grounds
upon which it is based clearly and specifically therein stated, with the
Chairman of the Roads Boards, Private Bag 12005, Ausspannplatz, 9000,
within a period of thirty days from the date of publication of this notice.

SCHEDULE 1

From a point (F on sketch-map P1491) on the farm Remainder of Auheib

- 408 generally east-north-eastwards and more and more eastwards across the

said farm to a point (G on sketch-map P1491) on the said farm; thence
generally eastwards across the said farm and the farms Remainder of
Vereniging 592, Portion 3 of Vereniging 592, Portion 1 of Hansie 406 and
Doornlaagte 406 to a point (H on sketch-map P1491) on the common
boundary of the last-mentioned farm and the farm Portion 1 of Hertzog 469;
thence generally eastwards across the last-mentioned farm and the farm
Annexe 472 to a point (J on sketch-map P1491) on the common boundary of
the last-mentioned farm and the farm La Salle 463; thence generally east-
north-eastwards across the last-mentioned farm and the farm Steynsberg
464 to a point (K on sketch-map P1491) on the last-mentioned farm; thence
generally eastwards across the last-mentioned farm and the farms Morester
465 and Zelda 466 to a point (L on sketch-map P1491) on the common
boundary of the last-mentioned farm and the farm Somali 467; thence
generally east-north-eastwards across the last-mentioned farm and the farms
Portion 1 of Sandfontein 468 and Portion 3 of Sandfontein 468 to a point (M



Government Gazette 2 December 1991

No. 309

on sketch-map P1491) on the last-mentioned farm; thence generally east-
north-eastwards across the last-mentioned farm and the farm Remainder of
Sandfontein 468 to a point (N on sketch-map P1491) on the eastern
boundary of the last-mentioned farm which is also the international border
of Namibia and Botswana.

SCHEDULE II

From a point (F on sketch-map P1491) on the farm Remainder of Auheib
408 generally east-north-eastwards across the said farm to a point (F27 on
sketch-map P1491) on the said farm.

SCHEDULE III

From a point (F1 on sketch-map P1491) on the farm Remainder of Auheib
408 generally eastwards and more and more east-south-eastwards across the
said farm to a point (F2 on sketch-map P1491) on the said farm; thence
generally south-south-eastwards and more and more east-south-eastwards
across the said farm and the farm Hester 407 to a point (F3 on sketch-map
P1491) on the common boundary of the last-mentioned farm and the farm
Portion 3 of Vereniging 592.

SCHEDULE IV

From a point (F5 on sketch-map P1491) on the farm Portion | of Hansie 406
generally east-north-eastwards and more and more eastwards across the said
farm and the farm Doornlaagte 406 to a point (F6 on sketch-map P1491) on
the last-mentioned farm; thence generally south-eastwards across the last-
mentioned farm to a point (F7 on sketch-map P1491) on the last-mentioned
farm; thence generally south-eastwards across the last-mentioned farm and
the farm Remainder of Hertzog 469 to a point (F8 on sketch-map P1491) on
the last-mentioned farm.

SCHEDULE V

From a point (F10 on sketch-map P1491) on the farm Remainder of Hertzog
469 generally eastwards across the said farm and the farm Prelim 471 to a
point (F11 on sketch-map P1491) on the last-mentioned farm.

SCHEDULE VI

From a point (A on sketch-map R1491) at the junction of the streets named
Main Road and Church Street in the urban area of Gobabis generally
eastwards along Church Street to a point (B on sketch-map P1491) on the
last-mentioned street; thence generally eastwards along the last-mentioned
street to a point (C on sketch-map P1491) on the common boundary of the



No. 309

Government Gazette 2 December 1991

eastern side of the urban area of Gobabis and the Townlands of Gobabis 1 14;
thence generally eastwards across the said Townlands to a point (D on
sketch-map P1491) on the said Townlands; thence generally east-north-
eastwards across the said Townlands and the farms Wendelstein 171 and
Portion I (Zwergfarm) of Welkom 412 to a point (E on sketch-map P1491)
on the last-mentioned farm; thence generally east-north-eastwards across
the last-mentioned farm and the farms Portion 2 (Soligen) of Welkom 412,
Remainder of Welkom 412, Halma 411 and the Remainder of Auheib 408 to
a point (F on sketch-map P1491) on the last-mentioned farm.

SCHEDULE VII

From a point (F8 on sketch-map P1491) on the farm Remainder of Hertzog
469 generally east-south-eastwards across the said farm to a point (F9 on
sketch-map P1491) on the said farm; thence generally east-south-eastwards
across the said farm to a point (F10 on sketch-map P1491) at the junction
with district road 1707 on the said farm.

SCHEDULE VIII

From a point (F13 on sketch-map P1491) on the farm Portion 1 of Babi-Babi
294 generally eastwards across the said farm and the farm Portion 1 of
Grauwater 296 to a point (F26 on sketch-map P1491) on the last-mentioned
farm.

SCHEDULE IX

From a point (F26 on sketch-map P1491) on the farm Portion 1 of
Grauwater 296 generally east-south-eastwards across the said farm to a point
(F14 on sketch-map P1491) on the said farm; thence generally north-
eastwards across the said farm to a point (F15 on sketch-map P1491) on the
said farm; thence generally eastwards and more and more north-eastwards
across the said farm to a point (F16 on sketch-map P1491) on the said farm;
thence generally east-south-eastwards across the said farm to a point (F17 on
sketch-map P1491) on the common boundary of the said farm and the farm
Remainder of Grauwater 296, thence generally eastwards across the last-
mentioned farm and the farm Groot Dabis 987 to a point (F18 on sketch-
map P1491) on the last-mentioned farm; thence generally east-south-
eastwards across the last-mentioned farm and the farms Portions 2 of Dabis
298 and Haakdoorn 300 to a point (F19 on sketch-map P1491) on the
last-mentioned farm; thence generally south-south-eastwards across the last-
mentioned farm to a point (F20 on sketch-map P1491) on the last-mentioned
farm; thence generally eastwards across the last-mentioned farm and the
farm Remainder of Blouberg 476 to a point (F21 on sketch-map P1491) on
the last-mentioned farm; thence generally east-north-eastwards across the
last-mentioned farm to a point (F22 on sketch-map P1491) on the last-
mentioned farm; thence generally north-eastwards across the last-mentioned
farmto a point (F23 on sketch-map P1491) on the common boundary of the
last-mentioned farm and the farm Portion 1 of Blouberg 476; thence



Government Gazette 2 December 1991 -

No. 309

generally north-eastwards and more and more east-north-eastwards across
the last-mentioned farm and the farms Remainder of Dawis 477, Portion 1 of
Sandfontein 468 and Portion 3 of Sandfontein 468 to a point (F24 on
sketch-map P1491) on the last-mentioned farm; thence generally north-
north-eastwards and more and more northwards across the last-mentioned
farm to a point (F25 on sketch-map P1491) at the place known as Buitepos.

SCHEDULE X

From a point (F27 on sketch-map P1491) on the farm Remainder of Auheib
408 generally east-north-eastwards across the said farm to a point (F1 on
sketch-map P1491) on the said farm.

SCHEDULE XI

From a point (F3 on sketch-map P1491) on the common boundary of the
farms Hester 407 and Groot Quinta 976 generally east-south-eastwards and
more and more eastwards across the last-mentioned farm to a point (F4 on
sketch-map P1491) at the junction with district road 1603 on the last-
mentioned farm; thence generally eastwards and more and more east-north-
eastwards across the last-mentioned farm and the farm Portion 1 of Hansie
406 to a point (F5 on sketch-map P1491) at the junction with farm road 1704
on the last-mentioned farm.

SCHEDULE XII

From a point (F11 on sketch-map P1491) on the farm Prelim 471 generally
east-south-eastwards across the last-mentioned farm and the farms Annexe
472 and Portion 1 of Babi-Babi 294 to a point (F12 on sketch-map P1491) on
the last-mentioned farm; thence generally east-north-eastwards across the
last-mentioned farm to a point (J15 on sketch-map P1491) on the last-
mentioned farm; thence generally north-eastwards and more and more
east-north-eastwards across the last-mentioned farm to a point (F13 on
sketch-map P1491) on district road 1681 on the last-mentioned farm.

SCHEDULE XIII

From a point (G2 on sketch-map P1491) on the farm Portion 1 of Siegfeld
403 generally south-eastwards and more and more east-south-eastwards
across the said farm and the farm Remainder of Houthak 404 to a point (H1
on sketch-map P1491) on district road 1603 on the last-mentioned farm.



No. 309

Government Gazette 2 December 1991

SCHEDULE XIV

From a point (H2 on sketch-map P1491) on the farm Etna 405 generally
eastwards and more and more east-north-eastwards across the said farmto a
point (H3 on sketch-map P1491) on the said farm; thence generally east-
north-eastwards across the said farm and the farm Pugeot 462 to a point (H4
on sketch-map P1491) on the last-mentioned farm; thence generally east-
north-eastwards across the last-mentioned farm to a point (HS on sketch-
map P1491) on the last-mentioned farm; thence generally north-eastwards
and more and more east-north-eastwards across the last-mentioned farm
and the farm La Salle 463 to a point (H6 on sketch-map P1491) at the
junction with farm road 1690 on the last-mentioned farm.

SCHEDULE XV

From a point (F1 on sketch-map P1491) on the farm Remainder of Auheib
408 generally north-north-eastwards across the said farm to a point (G5 on
sketch-map P1491) on the said farm.

SCHEDULE XVI

From a point (G5 on sketch-map P1491) on the farm Remainder of Auheib
408 generally north-north-eastwards across the said farm and the farm
Portion 1 of Siegfeld 403 to a point (G1 on sketch-map P1491) on the
last-mentioned farm; thence generally north-eastwards across the last-
mentioned farm to a point (G2 on sketch-map P1491) on the last-mentioned
farm; thence generally north-north-eastwards and more and more north-
eastwards across the last-mentioned farm and the farm Portion 1 of
Houthak 404 to a point (G3 on sketch-map P1491) on the last-mentioned
farm; thence generally north-north-eastwards across the last-mentioned
farm to a point (G4 on sketch-map P1491) on the common boundary of the
last-mentioned farm and the farm Welgelegen 396.

SCHEDULE XVII

From a point (H1 on sketch-map P1491) on the farm Remainder of Houthak
404 generally east-north-eastwards and more and more eastwards across the
said farm and the farm Etna 405 to a point (H2 on sketch-map P1491) on the
last-mentioned farm.

SCHEDULE XVIII

From a point (H6 on sketch-map P1491) on the farm La Salle 463 generally
east-north-eastwards across the said farm and the farm Dannhauser 718 to a
point (H7 on sketch-map P1491) on the last-mentioned farm.




Government Gazette 2 December 1991

No. 309

SCHEDULE XIX

From a point (Al on sketch-map P1491) on the farm Remainder of
Bitterpan 710 generally south-eastwards and more and more east-south-
eastwards across the said farm to a point (A2 on sketch-map P1491) on the
common boundary of the last-mentioned farm and the farm Suiderkruis 936.

SCHEDULE XX

From a point (J7 on sketch-map P1491) on the farm Remainder of Babi-
Babi 294 generally east-north-eastwards across the said farm to a point (J8
on sketch-map P1491) on district road 1681 on the said farm.

SCHEDULE XXI

From a point (J15 on sketch-map P1491) on the farm Portion 1 of Babi-Babi
294 generally southwards and more and more south-south-eastwards across
the said farm to a point (J4 on sketch-map P1491) on the said farm; thence
generally east-north-eastwards and more and more eastwards across the said
farm and the farm Remainder of Babi-Babi 294 to a point (J5 on sketch-map
P1491) on the last-mentioned farm; thence generally south-south-eastwards
across the last-mentioned farm to a point (J6 on sketch-map P1491) on the
last-mentioned farm; thence generally east-north-eastwards across the last-
mentioned farm to a point (J7 on sketch-map P1491) on the last-mentioned
farm.

SCHEDULE XXII

From a point (J10 on sketch-map P1491) on farm road 1827 on the farm
Remainder of Babi-Babi 294 generally south-south-eastwards and more and
more south-eastwards across the said farm to a point (J11 on sketch-map
P1491) on the said farm; thence generally east-north-eastwards and more
and more eastwards across the said farm and the farm Remainder of
Grauwater 296 to a point (J12 on sketch-map P1491) on the last-mentioned
farm; thence generally eastwards and more and more south-eastwards across
the last-mentioned farm and the farm Molly 297 to a point (J13 on sketch-
map P1491) on the last-mentioned farm; thence generally south-south-
eastwards across the last-mentioned farm to a point (J14 on sketch-map
P1491) on the last-mentioned farm.

SCHEDULE XXIII

From a point (F7 on sketch-map P1491) on the farm Doornlaagte 406
generally northwards across the said farm and the farm Etna 405 to a point
(H3 on the sketch-map P1491) on the last-mentioned farm.



No. 309

Government Gazette 2 December 1991

SCHEDULE XXIV

From a point (F9 on sketch-map P1491) on the farm Remainder of Hertzog
469 generally north-north-eastwards across the said farm and the farms
Portion 1 of Hertzog 467 and Pugeot 462 to a point (HS5 on sketch-map
P1491) on the last-mentioned farm.

SCHEDULE XXV

From a point (F12 on sketch-map P1491) on the farm Portion | of Babi-
Babi 294 generally north-north-westwards across the said farm and the
farm Annexe 472 to a point (J1 on sketch-map P1491) on the last-mentioned
farm; thence generally north-north-westwards across the last-mentioned
farmto a point (J2 on sketch-map P1491) on the last-mentioned farm; thence
generally north-north-westwards across the last-mentioned farm and the
farm La Salle 463 to a point (J3 on sketch-map P1491) on the last-mentioned
farm; thence generally north-westwards across the last-mentioned farmto a
point (H6 on sketch-map P1491) on the last-mentioned farm.

SCHEDULE XXVI

From a point (F16 on sketch-map P1491) on the farm Portion 1 of
Grauwater 296 generally northwards across the said farm and the farm
Singapore 473 to a point (K2 on sketch-map P1491) on the last-mentioned
farm; thence generally north-north-eastwards across the last-mentioned
farm to a point (K1 on sketch-map P1491) on the common boundary of the
last-mentioned farm and the farm Steynsberg 464.

SCHEDULE XXVII

From a point (L1 on sketch-map P1491) on the farm Zelda 466 generally
west-north-westwards and more and more north-north-westwards across
the said farm to a point (L2 on sketch-map P1491) on the said farm; thence
generally north-westwards across the said farm and the farm Moérester 465 to
a point (L3 on sketch-map P1491) on district road 1692 on the last-
mentioned farm.

SCHEDULE XXVIII

From a point (FI9 on sketch-map P1491) on the farm Haakdoorn 300
generally north-westwards across the said farm to a point (06 on sketch-map
P1491) on the said farm; thence generally northwards and more and more
north-north-eastwards across the said farm to a point (05 on sketch-map
P1491) on the said farm; thence generally east-north-eastwards across the
said farm to a point (04 on sketch-map P1491) on the said farm; thence



10

Government Gazette 2 December 1991

No. 309

generally northwards across the said farm to a point (03 on sketch-map
P1491) on the said farm; thence generally north-eastwards across the said
farmto a point (02 on sketch-map P1491) on the said farm; thence generally
west-north-westwards across the said farm to a point (01 on sketch-map
P1491) on the said farm; thence generally north-north-eastwards and more
and more northwards across the said farm to a point (0 on sketch-map
P1491) on the common boundary of the said farm and the farm Zelda 466;
thence generally north-eastwards across the last-mentioned farm to a point
(L1 on sketch-map P1491) on the last-mentioned farm.

SCHEDULE XXIX

From a point (F23 on sketch-map P1491) on the farm Portion 1 of Biouberg
476 generally north-westwards across the said farm to a point (M3 on
sketch-map P1491) on the said farm; thence generally northwards across the
said farm and the farm Somali 467 to a point (M2 on sketch-map P1491) on
the last-mentioned farm; thence generally north-north-westwards across the
last-mentioned farm to a point (M1 on sketch-map P1491) on the last-
mentioned farm; thence generally north-north-eastwards and more and
more northwards across the last-mentioned farm to a point (P on sketch-
map P1491) on the common boundary of the last-mentioned farm and the
farm Farm 461.

General Notices

MUNICIPALITY OF WINDHOEK
No. 177 1991
AMENDMENT OF WATER SUPPLY REGULATIONS

The council of the Municipality of Windhoek has under section 242 of the
Municipal Ordinance, 1963 (Ordinance 13 of 1963), further amended the
Water Supply Regulations promulgated by Government Notice 138 of 1973,
as set out in the Schedule.

The said amendments have been approved by the President under section
243 of the said Municipal Ordinance, 1963.



No. 309 Government Gazette 2 December 1991 11

SCHEDULE
Annexure A is hereby amended -
(a) by the substitution for paragraph 1 of the following paragraph:
“1. BASIC CHARGE:

Each consumer shall, in addition to any other tariff payable in terms
of any other paragraph of this Annexure, pay the following basic
charge to the council, whether water was consumed or not,
determined according to the diameter of the meter inlet:

Diameter of meter inlet Basic monthly charge

15 mm R7,75 which amount includes 5 kilo-
litres of water;

20 mm R15,50 which amount includes 10
kilolitres of water;

25 mm R23,25 which amount includes 15
kilolitres of water;

40 mm R38,75 which amount includes 25
kilolitres of water;

50 mm R54,25 which amount includes 35
kilolitres of water;

80 mm R77,50 which amount includes 50
kilolitres of water;

100 mm R100,75 which amount includes 65
kilolitres of water;

150 mm and bigger R139,50 which amount includes 50
kilolitres of water™ and

(b) by the substitution for paragraph 2 of the following paragraph:
“2. TARIFF BASED ON CONSUMPTION:

For consumption in excess of the volume included in the basic tariff
an amount of R1,55 is payable per kilolitre for every kilolitre of
water consumed”.




12

Government Gazette 2 December 1991

No. 309

CITY OF WINDHOEK
No. 178 1991

PERMANENT CLOSING OF PORTIONS | AND 2
OF PUBLIC OPEN SPACE ERF 5655 WINDHOEK

Notice i1s hereby given in terms of Section 183(1)(b)(ii) of the Municipal
Ordinance, 1963 (Ordinance No. 13 of 1963) as amended, that the
Municipality of Windhoek proposes to close permanently the under-
mentioned portions as indicated on plan P2635/ A which lies for inspection
during office hours at the office of the Town Planner, Room 702, Municipal
Offices, Independence Avenue.

Portions 1 and 2 of Public Open Space Erf 5655 Windhoek

Objections to the proposed closing are to be served on the Director, Local
Authorities and Development Planning, Private Bag 13289, and the Town
Clerk, P.O. Box 59, Windhoek, within 30 days after the appearance of this
notice in accordance with Article 183(3) of the above Ordinance.

J.G.B. BLIGNAUT
TOWN CLERK

CITY OF WINDHOEK
No. 179 1991

PERMANENT CLOSING OF PORTION A OF
PUBLIC OPEN SPACE ERF 789 OLYMPIA

Notice is hereby given in terms of Section 183(1)(b)(ii) of the Municipal
Ordinance, 1963 (Ordinance No. 13 of 1963) as amended, that the
Municipality of Windhoek proposes to close permanently the undermen-
tioned portions as indicated on plan P/2703/A which lies for inspection
during office hours at the office of the Town Planner, Room 702, Municipal
Offices, Independence Avenue.

Portion A of Public Open Space Erf 789 Olympia.

Objections to the proposed closing are to be served on the Director, Local
Authorities and Development Planning, Private Bag 13289, and the Town
Clerk, P.O. box 59, Windhoek, within 30 days after the appearance of this
notice in accordance with Article 183(3) of the above Ordinance.

J.G.B. BLIGNAUT
TOWN CLERK




No. 309

Government Gazette 2 December 1991

13

CITY OF WINDHOEK
No. 180 1991

PERMANENT CLOSING OF PORTION X OF
ORION STREET, DORADO PARK EXTENSION 1

Notice is hereby given in terms of Section 183(1)(b)(ii) of the Municipal
Ordinance, 1963 (Ordinance No. 13 of 1963) as amended, that the
Municipality of Windhoek proposes to close permanently the undermen-
tioned portions as indicated on plan P/2736/A which lies for inspection
during office hours at the office of the Town Planner, Room 702, Municipal
Offices, Independence Avenue.

Portion X of Orion Street, Dorado Park, Extension 1.

Objections to the proposed closing are to be served on the Director, Local
Authorities and Development Planning, Private Bag 13289, and the Town
Clerk, P.O. Box 59, Windhoek, within 30 days after the appearance of this
notice in accordance with Article 183(3) of the above Ordinance.

J.G.B. BLIGNAUT
TOWN CLERK

MUNICIPALITY OF GROOTFONTEIN
No. 181 1991

PERMANENT CLOSURE OF PUBLIC OPEN SPACES:
A. Erf 458, Grootfontein,
B. Erf 380, Grootfontein and
C. Portion 2/814 of Grootfontein Townlands.

Notice is hereby given in terms of Section 183(1)(b)(ii) of the Municipal
Ordinance (Ordinance 13 of 1963), as amended, that the Municipality
intends to close permanently for public use the open spaces as indicated on
plan 263 580xSL. This plan is open for inspection during office hours at the
offices of the Municipality of Grootfontein.

Objections against the proposed closure must in accordance with Section
183(3) of the above-mentioned Ordinance be served within thirty (30) days
after the last appearance of this notice to the Permanent Secretary, Ministry
of Local Government and Housing, Private Bag 13289, Windhoek, 9000.

TOWN CLERK
GROOTFONTEIN




14

Government Gazette 2 December 1991

No. 309

MUNICIPALITY OF GOBABIS
No. 182 1991

PERMANENT CLOSING OF PARTS OF STREETS

Noti'ce is hereby given in terms of Section 183(1)(b)(i1) of the Municipal
Ordinancef, 1964 (Ordinance 13 of 1963) as amended, that the Municipality
of Gobabis intends to close parts of Hoofweg, Voortrekker Street and Mark
Street between erven 25 and 55.

Objections to the proposed closure must reach the Town Clerk within thirty
(30) days of the appearance of this notice.

J.A. VAN DER MERWE P.O. Box 33
TOWN CLERK GOBABIS

THE PATENTS, DESIGNS, TRADE MARKS AND
COPYRIGHT ACT, 1916 (ACT NO. 9 OF 1916)

No. 183 1991

APPLICATION FOR THE RESTORATION OF A
LAPSED PATENT UNDER SECTION 53 OF THE ACT

Notice is hereby given that GERT DIEDERICK SCHERMANN UYS
of 5 River Street, Christiana, Transvaal Province, Republic of South Africa,
has made application for the restoration of the patent granted to the said
GERT DIEDERICK SCHERMANN UYS for an invention entitled
«COMPOSITE MATERIAL”, number 88/0045 and dated May 11, 1988
owing to the non-payment of the prescribed renewal fee.

Any person may give notice on Patent Form 19 of the opposition to the
restoration of the patent within two months of the advertisement thereof.

B.C. SCHUTTE
REGISTRAR OF PATENTS




No. 309

Government Gazette 2 December 1991

BANK OF NAMIBIA

No. 184

1991

STATEMENT OF ASSETS AND LIABILITIES
AS AT THE CLOSE OF BUSINESS ON 31 OCTOBER 1991

LIABILITIES:

Share Capital ...,
General Reserve ...,

Revaluation Reserve ..o,
Special Reserve ...,

Deposits:
Government ..o,
Bankers — Current .....oooooooeen.....
— Reserve_ ............................
Other oo

Allocation of Special Drawing
Rights .....cooovooee,

Other Liabilities ......occoooovveveen,
TOTAL LIABILITIES .....cccccc........

ASSETS

External:
Rand Coin ...ooooovveveeeeeeeeceen,
Balances with other banks ...........
IMF — Reserve tranche ...
— Special drawing rights
— Rand Subscription .......

Investments — Rand Currency ...
— Other Currency ...

Domestic:

Loans and advances ............cccc.........
Claims on the Government ..............
Fixed assets ...,
Other assets ..o,

ERIK KARLSSON
ACTING GOVERNOR

31-10-1991 30-09-1991
R R

14 165 471 12 887 049

147 699 147 699

491 717 449 032

443 096 443 096

124 230 583 77 000 928

986 178

20 518 000 22 904 000

715 597 732 221

436 266 1 281 648

161 149 415 115 845 851

276 951 303 251

180 534 112 160

37 418 36 958

657 634 657 634

134 268 363 92 505 851

6 690 729 6 825 592

8 920 510 8 934 158

10 117 276 6 470 247

161 149 415 115 845 851
E. LULE

GENERAL MANAGER




16

Government Gazette 2 December 1991

No. 309

No. 185 1991
GROOTFONTEIN AMENDMENT SCHEME NO. 1|

Notice is hereby given in terms of Section 23 of the Town Planning
Ordinance 1954, (Ordinance 18 of 1954) that the Grootfontein Amendment
Scheme No. 1 has been submitted to the Cabinet for approval.

Copies of the Amendment Scheme No. I and of the maps, plans, documents
and other relevant matters are lying for inspection during office hours at the
Grootfontein Municipality and also at the National Planning Commission,
Government Building, 5th Floor West, Room 530, Windhoek.

Any person who wishes to object to the approval of the Amendment Scheme
should lodge objections in writing to the Secretary, National Planning
Advisory Board (NAMPAB), Private Bag 13356, Windhoek on or before 16
January 1992.

No. 186 1991
KAPPS FARM TOWN PLANNING SCHEME

Notice is hereby given in terms of Section 23 of the Town Planning
Ordinance 1954 (Ordinance 18 of 1954) that the Kapps Farm Town Planning
Scheme has been submitted to the Cabinet for approval.

Copies of the Amendment Scheme and of the maps, plans, documents and
other relevant matters are lying for inspection during office hours at the
Peri-Urban Development Board and also at the National Planning Com-
mission, Government Building, 5th Floor West, Room 530, Windhoek.

Any person who wishes to object to the approval of the Amendment Scheme
should lodge his objections in writing to the Secretary, National Planning
Advisory Board (NAMPAB), Private Bag 13356, Windhoek on or before
16 January 1992.

No. 187 1991
ARIS TOWN PLANNING SCHEME

Notice is hereby given in terms of Section 23 of the Town Planning
Ordinance 1954 (Ordinance 18 of 1954) that the Aris Town Planning Scheme
has been submitted to the Cabinet for approval.

Copies of the Amendment Scheme and of the maps, plans, documents and
other relevant matters are lying for inspection during office hours at the
Peri-Urban Development Board and also at the National Planning Com-
mission, Government Building, 5th Floor West, Room 530, Windhoek.



No. 309

Government Gazette 2 December 1991 17

Any person who wishes to object to the approval of the Amendment Scheme
should lodge his/her objections in writing to the Secretary, National
Planning Advisory Board (NAMPAB), Private Bag 13356, Windhoek on or
before 16 January 1992.

MUNICIPALITY OF OUTJO
No. 188 1991
AMENDMENT OF NATIVE LOCATION REGULATIONS

In terms of section 32(4) bis of the Native (Urban Areas) Proclamation, 1951
(Proclamation 56 of 1951) notice is hereby given that the Council of the
Municipality of Outjo has under section 32 of the said Proclamation
amended the Native Location Regulations promulgated under Government
Notice 49 of 1937 as set out in the Schedule.

SCHEDULE
Regulation 17 is hereby amended by the substitution -
(a) in item 3 for the amount “R100,00” of the amount “R70,00”;
(b) in item 4(1) for the amount “R150,00” of the amount “R90,00”;
(c) in item 4(2) for the amount “R130,00” of the amount “R80,00”;
(d) in item 4(3) for the amount “R27,00” of the amount “R32,50;
(e) in item 4(4) for the amount “R23,00” of the amount “R27,50”;
() in item 4(5) for the amount “R18,00” of the amount “R21,50”;
(g) in item 4(6) for the amount “R14,00” of the amount “R16,50”;
(h) in item 4(7) for the amount “R10,50” of the amount “R12,50”; and

(i) in item 4(8) for the amount “R8,50” of the amount “R10,00”.




18

Government Gazette 2 December 1991

No. 309

MUNICIPALITY OF GROOTFONTEIN
No. 189 1991
AMENDMENT OF ABATTOIR REGULATIONS

In terms of section 243(2) bis of the Municipal Ordinance, 1963 (Ordinance
13 of 1963) notice is hereby given that the council of the Municipality of
Grootfontein has under section 242 of the said Ordinance amended the
Abattoir Regulations promulgated under Government Notice 83 of 1964 as
set out in the Schedule.

SCHEDULE
Schedule A is hereby amended:

(a) by the substitution in paragraph 1(i) and (ii) for the figures “45 kg” of the
figures “100 kg”;

(b) by the substitution in paragraph 2(i) and (ii) for the figures “45 kg” of the
figures “100 kg”; and

(c) by the substitution in paragraphs 3 and 4 for the figures “45 kg” wherever
they occur of the figures “100 kg”.

Printed by and obtainable from
WINDHOEK PRINTERS & PUBLISHERS (PTY) LTD.
P.O. Box 1707 — Windhoek 9000 — Namibia



